KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1 October 31, 2010 Account No: 269-0000M Statement No: 13773

General City Attorney Services FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

10/01/2010	MJK	Telephone call to J. Howard; phone call with	Hours
		Mayor; review of Block e-mail regarding mention of Christmas tree lighting on City website.	0.70
10/04/2010	AMS	Review Model Traffic Ordinance and WAC compliance issues; multiple discussions with M. King related to same.	0.40
10/06/2010	MJK	Review PRR for exemptions and redactions.	0.50
10/11/2010	MJK	Review of Forbes new PRR; phone call with J. Beavers regarding same.	0.70
10/12/2010	MJK	Review PRR's for exemptions and redactions.	0.70
10/13/2010	MJK	Review documents and e-mails from J. Beavers.	0.40
10/15/2010	MJK	Phone call with Mayor regarding PRRs; review new PRRs for exemptions.	1.50
10/19/2010	MJK AMS	Review documents for exemptions. Discussion with M. King related to public	1.30
		records requests.	0.70
10/20/2010	AMS	Review documents for PRR; telephone call with M. King related to same; research case law related to same.	1.50
	MJK	Phone call with Mayor and staff regarding PRR requests; telephone conference with A. Soto regarding PRR review.	1.30
10/21/2010	AMS	Review documents related to PRR; e-mail to M.	1,50
		King related to same; discussion with B. Sterbank, S. Kerslake and M. King related to	
		same.	2.80
10/22/2010	AMS	Review case law related to public records act.	1.00
10/25/2010	AMS	Review case law and documents related to public records requests.	1.20
	MJK	Review new PRR's for exemptions and redactions.	2.10

City of Gold Bar

\$3,428.00

Page: 2 October 31, 2010 Account No: 269-0000M

Statement No: 13773

General City Attorney Services FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Balance Due

TT	_	 ~	_	

				1	Hours	
10/28/2010	MJK AMS	Phone call with P. Brenton; review e-m J. Beavers; conference with K. Swoyer. Review documents related to public red request; discussion with M. King relat same; e-mail to P. Brenton related to	cords ted to		0.70	
	KIS	telephone call from P. Brenton related Review letters from W. Crittenden regasscanning documents.	d to same.		3.50	
		70 Mg 10000000000000000000000000000000000		-	0.20	
		For Current Services Rendered		2	21.20	3,428.00
		Recapitulation				
	Ai Ma	imekeeper	Hours 11.10 9.90 0.20	Rate \$120.00 210.00 85.00		
		Total Current Work				3,428.00
		Previous Balance				\$3,484.20
		Payments				
10/22/2010		Payment				-3,484.20

KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1 October 31, 2010 Account No: 269-10000M Statement No: 13774

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

10/01/2010 M	MJK	Review documents; e-mails to J. Myers; phone	Hours
к	KIS	call with J. Beavers; conference with K. Swoyer; edit litigation documents. Finalize Joint Motion for Preassignment for	1.90
		delivery to judge.	0.80
10/04/2010 M	MJK	Review document from Mayor; review notices of depositions; draft letter to S. Forbes regarding same.	1 50
К	KIS	Review, format and proof M. King letter to S. Forbes; e-mail same to S. Forbes and client.	1.50
10/05/2010 S	SAL	Telephone call from and to bailiff to civil presiding judge regarding motion for pre-assignment; draft, edit and finalize	
М	MJK	calendar note; file and serve same. Prepare for and attend Executive Session; phone	1.40
		call with J. Myers.	1.10
10/06/2010 M K	KIS	Phone call with J. Prueher; phone call with L. Kelley regarding depositions. Telephone call from and to bailiff regarding joint motion for presentation and to confirm procedures; notify attorneys and make	0.70
		preparations to comply with deadlines; prepare calendar regarding depositions; review incoming e-mails; telephone call to P. Brenton regarding depositions and declarations.	1.90
10/07/2010 M		Review O'Neill v. City of Shoreline; phone calls with Jeff Myers; draft litigation documents; review letter from Susan Forbes; draft response	
K	KIS	to same. Review incoming letter from S. Forbes; review court rules; meet with M. King; telephone call	2.50
		from P. Brenton regarding declarations.	1.20
10/08/2010 K	MJK	Review, proof and finalize M. King letter and e-mail same to her. Draft litigation documents; research regarding same; finalize letter to S. Forbes regarding	0.30
		Jame, Finalize recter to 5. rotpes regarding	

Page: 2 October 31, 2010 Account No: 269-10000M Statement No: 13774

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		mediation and other litigation matters.	Hours 1.90
10/11/2010	KIS	Finalize M. King letter to S. Forbes.	0.20
10/12/2010	MJK	Draft litigation documents.	0.50
10/13/2010	KIS MJK	Review and format declarations; telephone call to court to confirm Joint Motion for Pre-Assignment; organize documents for file. Review and edit affidavit; conference with K. Swoyer regarding same; e-mail to J. Myers.	3.10 0.70
10/15/2010	MJK	Phone call with Mayor regarding litigation.	0.80
10/18/2010	MJK	Draft litigation documents.	0.50
10/20/2010	MJK	Edits to motion.	0.70
10/21/2010	KIS	Review S. Forbes letter regarding mediation and depositions; meet with M. King regarding depositions and declarations.	0.50
10/22/2010	KIS	Telephone call to and from City regarding Council meeting; meet with M. King regarding same; telephone call to court regarding judge assignment; compile information regarding judge and e-mail same to M. King.	0.60
10/25/2010	KIS	Telephone call to L. Kelly regarding declaration; review incoming notice of judge assignment, mail same to plaintiff and update pleading template and case information form.	0.60
10/26/2010	MJK	Prepare for and attend City Council Executive Session; prepare documents.	1.30
10/27/2010	SAL MJK	Proof, edit, and finalize L. Kelly declaration in support of City's motion for protective order; proof, edit, and finalize motion, M. King declaration and order regarding same. Draft Motion for Protective Order and related Declarations; phone call with Mayor; phone call	1.50
	KIS	with P. Brenton; review PRR documents and related e-mails. Telephone call to court clerk regarding motion noting requirements and procedures; prepare calendar note for motion for protective order; prepare L. Kelly and M. King declarations; prepare proposed order; telephone call to messenger service regarding procedures and deadlines; prepare messenger form; finalize motion documents for filing and service. Review and revise draft motion for protective order and declaration regarding same.	2.90
10/28/2010	KIS	Review incoming e-mail from S. Forbes; review e-mails from M. King; telephone call regarding	0.50

October 31, 2010

Account No: 269-10000M

Page: 3

Statement No: 13774

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

				Hou	rs
		declaration; prepare e-mail regarding retrieve and compile billing informat file; telephone call to judge's law c	ion for		
		regarding hearing.	IEIK	1.2	20
10/29/2010	MJK KIS	Phone conference with P. Brenton regal issues and declarations; phone call we Myers regarding PRR questions; review response to A. Block regarding Forbes depositions. Begin to organize pleadings for file; attorney and make preparations to commotion deadline; telephone call to la	ith J. and draft notify ply with	2.0	00
		confirm procedures; meet with M. King	regarding		
		declaration.		0.8	
		For Current Services Rendered		39.6	60 6,083.00
		Recapitulation			
		imekeeper	Hours	_Rate	
		heryl A. Loewen	2.90	\$90.00	
		argaret J. King	21.10	210.00	
		athy I. Swoyer	15.10	85.00	
	В	ob C. Sterbank	0.50	215.00	
		Expenses			
		Postage			
		Westlaw Computer Research			4.74 6.58
		Total Expenses Thru 10/31/2010			$\frac{0.30}{11.32}$
		Total Current Work			6,094.32
		Previous Balance			\$6,534.93
		Payments			
10/22/2010		Payment			6 524 02
10/22/2010		Laymone			-6,534.93
		Balance Due			\$6,094.32