

MARK R. BUCKLIN
MICHAEL C. WALTER
ANDREW G. COOLEY
STEWART A. ESTES
JAYNE L. FREEMAN
RICHARD B. JOLLEY
SHANNON M. RAGONESI
KIMBERLY J. WALDBAUM



KEATING, BUCKLIN & McCORMACK
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
Seattle, Washington 98104-3175
Phone: 206.623.8861
Fax: 206.223.9423
www.kbmlawyers.com

JEREMY W. CULUMBER
AMANDA G. BUTLER
BRIAN C. AUGENTHALER
RUTH NIELSEN
DEREK C. CHEN

OF-COUNSEL
BRENDA L. BANNON

ROBERT C. KEATING (1915-2001)

July 5, 2018

Ms. Lisa Stowe
107 5th Street
Gold Bar, WA 98251

RE: Gold Bar PRA 15-2-06148-6 adv. Block

Dear Ms. Stowe:

Please find enclosed our **Interim Fee Statement** for services rendered in the above-referenced matter.

Thank you for allowing us to be of service to you.

Sincerely,



Rechlida D. Grefalda
Billing Department

RG/encl

1269-001

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

July 03, 2018
Invoice 10736
Client Matter 1269-00001

City of Gold Bar
Lisa Stowe
107 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Fees Billed Inception to Date: **\$91,770.70**

Disbursements Billed Inception to Date: **\$10,066.41**

Regarding

Gold Bar PRA 15-2-06148-6 adv. Anne Block

Opened: 10/7/2016

File Type: Litigation-General

Claim#: PRA 15-2-06148-6

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional Services Rendered</u>	<u>Atty</u>	<u>Hours</u>
06/01/2018	Review and analyze Court of Appeals proceedings in preparation for opposing motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.70
06/01/2018	Review and analyze underlying trial court rulings in preparation for opposition to motion for discretionary review.	BCA	1.50
06/01/2018	Strategy and analysis regarding response to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.40
06/01/2018	Write "decision" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	1.30
06/01/2018	Research and analyze case law	BCA	0.30
06/01/2018	Write issue statement section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.10
06/01/2018	Research and analyze case law	BCA	0.80
06/01/2018	Write "untimely" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.50
06/01/2018	To Snohomish County Superior Court for hearing on motion for sanctions and return.	AGB	2.60
06/01/2018	Analyze Plaintiff's motion to continue.	AGB	0.20
06/01/2018	Prepare motion to continue Plaintiff's motion to stay.	AGB	0.60
06/01/2018	Strategy and analysis	AGB	0.30

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

06/01/2018	Prepare AGB Declaration in support of motion to shorten time.	AGB	0.50
06/01/2018	Prepare motion to shorten time.	AGB	0.50
06/02/2018	Continue work on motion to shorten time, motion to continue and AGB supporting declarations regarding the same.	AGB	2.30
06/03/2018	Write "statement of the case" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	1.80
06/03/2018	Write "obvious error and O'Neill" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	2.00
06/03/2018	Write "probable error and effect prong" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.70
06/03/2018	Write "partial grant" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.10
06/03/2018	Write "no circumstances" section of opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.20
06/03/2018	Prepare appendices to opposition to motion for discretionary review	BCA	0.40
06/04/2018	Telephone call and email to Anne Block.	AGB	0.10
06/04/2018	Prepare AGB declaration in support of motion to shorten time and exhibits thereto.	AGB	0.50
06/04/2018	Receive and review emails from Block.	AGB	0.10
06/04/2018	Email from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/04/2018	Prepare opposition to motion to stay.	AGB	2.90
06/04/2018	Prepare motion to continue motion to stay.	AGB	1.40
06/04/2018	Continue to prepare motion to shorten time and supporting evidence.	AGB	1.10
06/04/2018	Prepare AGB Declaration in support of opposition to motion for stay and exhibits to same.	AGB	0.70
06/04/2018	Prepare proposed order granting motion to shorten time.	AGB	0.20
06/04/2018	Prepare for motion to shorten time.	AGB	0.30
06/04/2018	Finalize opposition to motion for discretionary review.	SMR	0.30
06/05/2018	To Snohomish County Superior Court on Motion to Shorten Time and return to office.	AGB	2.90
06/05/2018	Prepare/finalize motion to continue motion to stay, declaration of AGB and exhibits thereto and proposed order regarding same.	AGB	0.10
06/05/2018	Multiple emails from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.20
06/05/2018	Message from witness.	AGB	0.10
06/05/2018	Strategy regarding litigation.	AGB	0.10
06/08/2018	Emails from potential witness.	AGB	0.10

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

06/11/2018	Receive and review Plaintiff's Motion to Modify, analysis regarding responding to same.	AGB	0.50
06/11/2018	Receive and review motion by plaintiff.	SMR	0.20
06/12/2018	Email from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/12/2018	Prepare information to present to Court regarding Notice of Unavailability,	AGB	0.40
06/14/2018	Telephone call regarding litigation.	AGB	0.20
06/14/2018	Email to Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/14/2018	Prepare outline of litigation history.	AGB	0.40
06/15/2018	Multiple emails from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.20
06/18/2018	Receive and review 5 emails from Anne Block and analysis regarding her allegations made in the same.	AGB	0.30
06/18/2018	Email from Court.	AGB	0.10
06/18/2018	Email from Court of Appeals.	AGB	0.10
06/18/2018	Email from Anne Block.	AGB	0.10
06/18/2018	Receive and review emails from Plaintiff.	SMR	0.30
06/18/2018	Prepare affidavit of service.	SMR	0.20
06/18/2018	Receive and review letter from JacQaline Harvey.	SMR	0.10
06/18/2018	E-mail from Kelsey O'Neal.	SMR	0.10
06/19/2018	Email from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/19/2018	Email from Block.	AGB	0.10
06/19/2018	Continue to prepare and file affidavit of service.	SMR	0.20
06/20/2018	Emails from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.20
06/22/2018	Emails from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.20
06/25/2018	Email from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/25/2018	Telephone call from Court.	AGB	0.20
06/26/2018	Email from client.	AGB	0.10
06/26/2018	Email from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10
06/26/2018	Telephone call with client.	AGB	0.20
06/26/2018	Prepare for hearing.	AGB	1.10
06/27/2018	Prepare timeline.	AGB	1.30
06/27/2018	To Snohomish County for hearing and return.	AGB	2.80
06/27/2018	Emails from Plaintiff.	AGB	0.10

Total Hours Billed: 39.20

Total for Services: 9977.40

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

<u>Attorney Recap</u>	<u>Personnel Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Brian C. Augenthaler	Associate	10.80	\$249.00
Amanda Butler	Senior Associate	27.00	\$255.00
Shannon M. Ragonesi	Shareholder	1.40	\$288.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Disbursements</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/07/2018	Amanda G. Butler / Parking during Hearing 06/05/18	3.00
06/07/2018	Amanda G. Butler / copies of records on 06/05/18	2.00
06/07/2018	Amanda G. Butler / to and from Snohomish County Superior Court for Hearing 06/05/18	22.13
06/07/2018	Amanda G. Butler / copies of records	1.00
06/07/2018	Amanda G. Butler / to and from Snohomish County Superior Court for Hearing 06/01/18	22.13
06/14/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 06/05/18; Defendant's opposition to Plaintiffs Motion to Stay; declaration of AGB; proposed order	285.00
06/14/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 06/01/18; court order	285.00
06/14/2018	ABC Legal Messengers / special delivery 05/31/18; Defendant's reply; SMR declaration with exhibits	85.85
06/14/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery 06/05/18; City's opposition to Plaintiffs Motion to Stay; declaration of AGB with exhibits; proposed order	83.00
06/14/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 05/31/18; Defendant's reply to Motion for 'Terms' declaration of SMR with exhibits	285.00
06/14/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 06/05/18; Calendar note; Defendant's Motion to Continue; declaration of AGB with exhibits; proposed order	285.00
06/21/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 06/06/18; Calendar Note; Defendant's Motion to Continue; declaration of AGB with exhibits; proposed order	105.50
06/28/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 6/15/18; Calendar note	285.00
06/28/2018	CourtTrax / April 2018 transaction searches	5.00
06/28/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 6/19/18; Affidavit of Service	285.00
06/30/2018	CourtTrax / June 2018 transaction searches	25.00
06/30/2018	Seattle Legal Messengers / Delivery on 6/19/18; Affidavit of Service	66.50

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

06/04/2018	Postage - Answer to Motion for Discretionary Review to Block	3.10
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (19)	3.80
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (20)	4.00
06/04/2018	Photocopies B&W (64)	12.80
06/05/2018	Postage - Response to Motion to Stay & Motion to Continue to Block	5.57
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (198)	39.60
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (18)	3.60
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (94)	18.80
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/05/2018	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (50)	10.00
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (11)	2.20
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (34)	6.80
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
06/14/2018	Photocopies B&W (120)	24.00
06/15/2018	Photocopies B&W (10)	2.00
06/18/2018	Photocopies B&W (40)	8.00
06/19/2018	Photocopies B&W (16)	3.20
06/26/2018	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
06/26/2018	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
06/26/2018	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
06/26/2018	Photocopies B&W (26)	5.20
06/26/2018	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
Total Disbursements		2,308.38

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

801 Second Avenue, Suite 1210
Seattle, WA 98104-1576

Payments

06/08/2018	Payment	City of Gold Bar	1,267.70
06/22/2018	Payment	City of Gold Bar	<u>6,998.80</u>
		Sub-total Payments:	\$8,266.50

Totals for this Matter

Prior Balance:	\$8,266.50
Payments Received:	\$8,266.50
Current Charges:	\$12,285.78
Balance Due:	\$12,285.78