

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

April 06, 2017
Invoice 9007
Client Matter 1269-00001

City of Gold Bar
Lisa Stowe
107 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Fees Billed Inception to Date: **\$12,567.80**

Disbursements Billed Inception to Date: **\$590.12**

Regarding

Gold Bar PRA 15-2-06148-6 adv. Anne Block
Opened: 10/7/2016
File Type: Litigation-General

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional Services Rendered</u>	<u>Atty</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/01/2017	Legal research.	DCC	0.20
03/01/2017	Prepare motion to strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	DCC	1.00
03/01/2017	Prepare argument and analysis for Defendant's Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Motion for partial summary judgment.	DCC	1.00
03/01/2017	Prepare Declaration of Shannon Ragonesi in support of Defendant's Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment and attached exhibits.	DCC	0.30
03/01/2017	Prepare proposed order granting Defendant's Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	DCC	0.10
03/01/2017	Research Washington case law.	DCC	0.40
03/01/2017	Emails from and to Dennis Goss.	SMR	0.20
03/01/2017	Telephone call to witness.	SMR	0.60
03/01/2017	Continue to assemble evidence for motion to compel.	SMR	1.00
03/01/2017	Continue to prepare motion to compel.	SMR	1.20
03/02/2017	Prepare motion to strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	DCC	1.80
03/02/2017	Prepare Declaration of Shannon Ragonesi in support of Defendant's Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment and attached exhibits.	DCC	1.20
03/02/2017	Research Washington case law.	DCC	0.60

2426 515 30 71 001 (30 928.85)

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/02/2017	Prepare proposed order granting the City's Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	DCC	0.20
03/02/2017	Prepare analysis for Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's Motion for partial summary judgment.	DCC	1.10
03/02/2017	Email to Anne Block.	SMR	0.10
03/02/2017	Receive and review motion to change trial date in King County matter.	SMR	0.10
03/02/2017	Emails from and to Anne Block.	SMR	0.80
03/02/2017	Telephone conference with witness.	SMR	0.20
03/02/2017	Emails from and to Kore Siegel.	SMR	0.20
03/02/2017	Plan strategy.	SMR	0.60
03/02/2017	E-mail from Dennis Goss.	SMR	0.10
03/02/2017	Receive and review emails from witness.	SMR	0.20
03/02/2017	Telephone conference with witness.	SMR	0.20
03/03/2017	Prepare initial response regarding the City's Motion to strike to Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	DCC	1.30
03/03/2017	Prepare Declaration of Shannon Ragonesi in support of the City's response to Plaintiff's motion for summary judgment and attached exhibits.	DCC	0.60
03/03/2017	Emails from and to Dennis Goss.	SMR	0.50
03/03/2017	Analyze plaintiff's summary judgment and prepare response.	SMR	4.50
03/04/2017	Emails from Anne Block.	SMR	0.20
03/06/2017	Prepare opposition to Plaintiff's motion for partial summary judgment.	SMR	4.30
03/06/2017	Legal research and analysis.	SMR	0.40
03/07/2017	Review status of hearings on docket.	SMR	0.10
03/07/2017	Review and analysis regarding J. Beavers deposition.	SMR	2.50
03/07/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.50
03/07/2017	E-mail from court clerk.	SMR	0.10
03/07/2017	Emails to and from Anne Block.	SMR	0.20
03/08/2017	Legal research issue regarding damages.	DCC	0.40
03/08/2017	Legal research regarding case law.	DCC	1.00
03/08/2017	Continue to prepare opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	SMR	2.20
03/08/2017	Email to Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.10
03/08/2017	Emails to and from Ann Marie Soto.	SMR	0.20
03/08/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/09/2017	Legal research and analysis.	SMR	0.70

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/09/2017	Email to Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.10
03/09/2017	Outline arguments to be addressed in motion to show cause.	SMR	5.00
03/09/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/09/2017	Telephone conference with Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.20
03/10/2017	Receive and review emails from Anne Block.	SMR	0.50
03/10/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/10/2017	Telephone conference with Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.20
03/13/2017	Telephone conference with Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.10
03/13/2017	Receive and review email from witness.	SMR	0.10
03/14/2017	Analysis regarding motion.	AGB	0.80
03/14/2017	Continue to prepare response to partial Summary Judgment motion.	SMR	7.10
03/14/2017	Receive and review Public Records Request documents produced by City.	SMR	0.90
03/14/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.10
03/14/2017	Legal research and analysis.	SMR	1.00
03/14/2017	Emails from and to Anne Block.	SMR	0.20
03/14/2017	Telephone conference with Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.10
03/15/2017	Research and analysis regarding constitutional challenge.	AGB	0.50
03/15/2017	Research and analysis regarding facial constitutional challenges.	AGB	0.60
03/15/2017	Research and analysis regarding PRA.	AGB	1.10
03/15/2017	Emails from Anne Block.	SMR	0.10
03/15/2017	Continue to prepare opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	SMR	7.50
03/16/2017	Continue research and analysis regarding constitutional claim.	AGB	0.80
03/16/2017	Prepare Motion for Summary Judgment response argument.	AGB	2.20
03/16/2017	Legal research PRA.	AGB	0.40
03/16/2017	Analyze Joe Beavers' deposition testimony.	AGB	0.30
03/16/2017	Receive and review records and assemble evidence to support motion.	SMR	6.80
03/16/2017	Telephone conferences with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/16/2017	Emails from and to Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.30
03/16/2017	Emails from and to Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.30
03/17/2017	Complete research, analysis, and briefing regarding Block's constitutional claim for opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	AGB	1.10

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/17/2017	Continue to prepare opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment including declarations and evidence.	SMR	8.10
03/19/2017	Continue to prepare opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	SMR	4.00
03/20/2017	Finalize opposition to motion, declarations and exhibits.	SMR	3.90
03/20/2017	Emails from Anne Block.	SMR	0.40
03/21/2017	E-mail from Noel Frederick.	SMR	0.10
03/21/2017	Prepare declaration of service.	SMR	0.50
03/22/2017	Telephone conference with Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.30
03/27/2017	Emails from Anne Block.	SMR	0.20
03/27/2017	Emails to and from Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/28/2017	Prepare opposition to motion to strike, declaration of SMR and exhibits, and proposed order.	SMR	7.00
03/28/2017	Telephone conference with Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.10
03/29/2017	Emails from and to Bonnie Jones.	SMR	0.20
03/29/2017	Emails to and from legal counsel.	SMR	0.30
03/29/2017	Emails from and to Srikanth Naidu.	SMR	0.20
03/30/2017	Emails from and to Anne Block.	SMR	0.60
03/30/2017	Email to Bonnie Jones and Ann Marie Soto.	SMR	0.10
03/30/2017	Email to Joe Beavers.	SMR	0.10
03/30/2017	Emails from and to the court.	SMR	0.30
03/31/2017	Emails from and to Anne Block.	SMR	0.30

Total Hours Billed: 99.30

Total for Services: 27526.00

<u>Attorney Recap</u>	<u>Personnel Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Amanda Butler	Senior Associate	7.80	\$252.00
Derek C. Chen	Associate	11.20	\$246.00
Shannon M. Ragonesi	Shareholder	80.30	\$284.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Disbursements</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/31/2017	ABC Legal Messengers; Defendant's opposition regarding Motion to Strike 03/29/17	80.00
03/31/2017	ABC Legal Messengers special delivery 03/03/17; note for motion to strike; declaration of SMR; exhibits A thru F; proposed order	39.95
03/31/2017	ABC Legal Messengers; Defendant's opposition regarding Motion to Strike and affidavit of Legal Messenger 03/29/17	65.15
03/31/2017	CourtTrax / Transaction searches for the month	183.00

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/31/2017	ABC Legal Messengers special delivery 03/20/17; Defendant's opposition; declaration of SMR and exhibits 1-12; declaration of Jones and exhibits 1-11; declaration of Beavers and exhibits 1-12; working copy to notebooks for civil motions judge, thumb drive to Anne Block for service	177.00
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/02/2017	Postage - re-send discovery of 11/4/17	5.34
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (30)	6.00
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/02/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/03/2017	Photocopies B&W (68)	13.60
03/03/2017	Photocopies B&W (34)	6.80
03/03/2017	Postage - Motion to Strike x 2 (2 separate addresses)	6.42
03/03/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/03/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/03/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/06/2017	Photocopies Color	1.05
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies Color	5.25
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies Color	1.05
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (15)	3.00
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (13)	2.60
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/06/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (9)	1.80
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/07/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies Color	9.80
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (10)	2.00
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (93)	18.60
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (90)	18.00
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/09/2017	Photocopies Color	70.70
03/09/2017	Photocopies Color	5.95
03/09/2017	Photocopies Color	14.00
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (199)	39.80
03/09/2017	Photocopies Color	14.00
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (4)	0.80
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/09/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/14/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/15/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/15/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/15/2017	Photocopies B&W (15)	3.00
03/16/2017	Photocopies Color	35.35

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (58)	11.60
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (9)	1.80
03/16/2017	Photocopies Color	17.85
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (17)	3.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (11)	2.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies Color	2.10
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (25)	5.00
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (9)	1.80
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/16/2017	Photocopies Color	1.75
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (24)	4.80
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/16/2017	Photocopies Color	1.05
03/16/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	43.75
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	0.35

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	39.90
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	21.00
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (5)	1.00
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (90)	18.00
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (14)	2.80
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	0.35
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	38.50
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	0.35
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	15.05
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	4.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (7)	1.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	1.75
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	1.75
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	67.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	35.70
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	40.95
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (12)	2.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies Color	36.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (66)	13.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/17/2017	Photocopies B&W (28)	5.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (33)	6.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies Color	5.25
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (8)	1.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (147)	29.40
03/20/2017	Photocopies Color	80.85
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (6)	1.20
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (147)	29.40
03/20/2017	Photocopies Color	5.60
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (33)	6.60
03/20/2017	Postage - letter encl disk w/def's opposition & sup Documents to Block at W. Main in Monroe	1.40
03/20/2017	Photocopies B&W (31)	6.20
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (3)	0.60
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (2)	0.40
03/21/2017	Photocopies B&W (1)	0.20
03/29/2017	Photocopies Color	18.55
03/29/2017	Photocopies Color	149.10
03/29/2017	Photocopies B&W (66)	13.20
03/29/2017	Photocopies B&W (20)	4.00

Keating, Bucklin & McCormack, Inc., P.S.

800 Fifth Avenue, Suite 4141
Seattle, WA 98104-3175

03/30/2017	Photocopies B&W (711)	142.20
03/30/2017	Photocopies B&W (492)	98.40
	Total Disbursements	<u>1,947.51</u>

Payments

03/27/2017	Payment	City of Gold Bar	4,156.60
	Sub-total Payments:		<u>\$4,156.60</u>

Totals for this Matter

Prior Balance:	\$4,156.60
Payments Received:	\$4,156.60
Current Charges:	\$29,473.51
Balance Due:	\$29,473.51