

Michael R. Kenyon
Rachel B. Turpin
Ann Marie J. Soto
Kim Adams Pratt
Robert F. Noe
David A. Linehan
Amy S. Mill
Charlotte A. Archer
Alexandra L. Kenyon



Bruce L. Disend
Doug F. Mosich
Of Counsel

RECEIVED OCT 11 2016

Shelley M. Kerslake
12/27/2014

October 6, 2016

City of Gold Bar
107 – 5th Street
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: September 2016 Billing

General City Attorney (269.000)	374.00
General City Attorney – General PRRs (269.001)	6691.08
Block1 v. City of Gold Bar (269.102)	6892.10
Block 5 v. City of Gold Bar (269.113)	<u>72.28</u>

Current Month's Charges **\$14,029.46**

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Lee Hodo
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
September 30, 2016
Account No: 269-00000M
Statement No: 184610

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

		Hours	
09/07/2016 AMS	Telephone call and e-mails to and from A. Butler related to new Block lawsuit (.6).	0.60	
09/08/2016 AMS	Review Answer (.3); e-mails and telephone calls to and from A. Butler related to Answer and depositions (.5).	0.80	
09/13/2016 AMS	Meeting with M. Kenyon related to various Gold Bar matters (.5).	0.50	
09/23/2016 AMS	Telephone calls to and from L. Hodo related to litigation (.3).	0.30	
	For Current Services Rendered	2.20	374.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	
Ann Marie Soto	2.20	\$170.00	
Total Current Work			374.00
Balance Due			<u>\$374.00</u>

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
 Attn: Mayor Lee Hodo
 107 - 5th Street
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
 September 30, 2016
 Account No: 269-00100M
 Statement No: 184611

City Attorney - General PRRs
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Previous Balance \$445.82

Fees

		Hours
09/07/2016	AMS Telephone call to B. Jones related to pending PRRs (.3).	0.30
09/16/2016	AMS Telephone call and e-mails to and from B. Jones related to West PRR (.2).	0.20
09/20/2016	MCS Search archived e-mails regarding Block PRR (.2).	0.20
09/21/2016	AMS Travel to and from City Hall and meeting with B. Jones related to pending PRRs (6.4).	6.40
09/22/2016	AMM Compile exempt documents and metadata for PRR 2012-094 (1.5); compile exempt documents and metadata for PRR 2012-067 (.5).	2.00
	AMS Review records for pending PRRs and discussions with A. Mattox and M. Starkey related to same (5.3).	5.30
	MCS Search archived e-mails for A. Soto regarding Block PRR (.4).	0.40
09/23/2016	AMM Continue compiling documents for PRR 2012-067 for A. Soto to review (2.7).	2.70
	TTC Assist in compiling documents for PRR 2012-067 for A. Soto to review (2.9).	2.90
	AMS Review and redact records related to pending PRRs; prepare exemption logs related to same (6.3).	6.30
09/26/2016	AMM Finish compiling documents for PRR 2012-067 for A. Soto to review (.5).	0.50
	AMS Review records related to pending PRRs (.8).	0.80
09/27/2016	AMS Travel to and from City Hall and meet with City staff regarding pending PRRs; review records related to same (7.3).	7.30
09/29/2016	AMS Review records related to pending PRRs; telephone call to B. Jones related to same (4.2).	4.20
09/30/2016	AMS Review and research records related to pending PRRs; telephone call and e-mail to B. Jones related to	

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
 Attn: Mayor Lee Hodo
 107 - 5th Street
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
 September 30, 2016
 Account No: 269-10200M
 Statement No: 184612

Block1 v. City of Gold Bar 11-2-04307-8
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED

Previous Balance \$20.00

Fees

		Hours
09/07/2016 AMM	Receive and review ruling from the court regarding Block's Motion to Stay Proceedings (.1); telephone call to court regarding copy of Block's motion (.1); finalize and mail correspondence to Block on behalf of A. Soto for noncompliance of service rules (.2).	0.40
AMS	Receive order from Court related to Block's Motion to Stay; telephone calls and e-mails to and from A. Mattox and letter to A. Block related to same (.5); research court rules (.2).	0.70
09/08/2016 AMM	Research Snohomish County hearing records regarding Block's hearing per her motion in the COA case (.3); draft shell pleading for City's Answer to Motion to Stay and Motion to Strike (.3); gather all open litigation case dockets for Block in King and Snohomish Counties (.2).	0.80
AMS	Review Block's Motion to Stay (.2); draft Answer to Motion to Stay and meeting with A. Mattox related to same (4.2).	4.40
09/09/2016 AMS	Continue drafting Answer to Motion to Stay and related case law research (5.3).	5.30
09/12/2016 AMM	Receive pleadings from A. Block for the state court case; scan to file and forward to A. Soto to review (.2).	0.20
09/13/2016 AMS	Review Motion to Vacate as related to pending COA action and research court rules related to same (.5); continue drafting Answer to Motion to Stay and related case law research (3.2).	3.70
09/14/2016 CAA	Continue to draft and revise exhibit to Declaration of A. Soto in support of Opposition to Appellant's Motion to Stay (1.5); continue to draft and revise Opposition to Appellant's Motion to Stay (1.6).	3.10
AMS	Continue drafting Answer to Motion to Stay and related case law and court rule research (4.5).	4.50

Blockl v. City of Gold Bar 11-2-04307-8
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED

	Hours	
09/15/2016 SAL		Review court docket regarding status of Report of Proceedings; proof and edit Answer to Motion to Stay; review Snohomish County Superior Court docket regarding status of Motions to Vacate; proof and edit A. Soto Declaration in Support of Answer (5.5).
	5.50	
KIS		Proof, edit, and finalize timeline of related litigation activity (1.4); meet with S. Loewen regarding brief and assist with citations (.5).
	1.90	
CAA		Continue to draft and revise Declaration of A. Soto in support of Opposition to Motion to Stay (2.3); conference with A. Soto regarding draft Opposition to Motion to Stay and Declaration of A. Soto in support thereof (.5) [NO CHARGE].
	2.80	
AMS		Continue drafting Answer to Motion to Stay and related Declaration with supporting exhibit preparation; research court rules related to same (7.8).
	7.80	
AMS		Review and revise Answer to Motion to Stay and related Declaration (2.2).
	2.20	
09/16/2016 KIS		Organize and prepare exhibits to A. Soto declaration in preparation for filing and service (1.0); proof, edit, and finalize brief and declaration for filing and service (1.6); submit brief and declaration to Court of Appeals for filing (.3); submit brief and declaration to plaintiff via mail (.3).
	3.20	
09/28/2016 AMS		Review Block's Motion to Stay; research court rules and telephone call to C. Archer related to same (.8).
	0.80	
	47.30	For Current Services Rendered
		6,815.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Antoinette M. Mattox	1.40	\$100.00
Ann Marie Soto	29.40	170.00
Sheryl A. Loewen	5.50	110.00
Charlotte A. Archer	2.80	0.00
Charlotte A. Archer	3.10	165.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	5.10	110.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	63.00
Postage	13.60
Total Expenses Thru 09/30/2016	76.60
Total Current Work	6,892.10

Payments

09/23/2016	Payment	-20.00
------------	---------	--------

Balance Due \$6,892.10

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
 Attn: Mayor Lee Hodo
 107 - 5th Street
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
 September 30, 2016
 Account No: 269-11300M
 Statement No: 184613

Block5 v. City of Gold Bar 15-2-06148-6
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Previous Balance \$1,151.72

Fees

		Hours	
09/12/2016 AMM	Receive pleadings from A. Block; scan to file and forward to A. Soto to review (.2).	0.20	
09/29/2016 AMM	Draft Notice of Intent to Videotape deposition of J. Beavers; forward to A. Soto (.3); finalize and mail Notices to A. Block (.2).	0.50	
	For Current Services Rendered	0.70	70.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Antoinette M. Mattox	0.70	\$100.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	0.90
Postage	1.38
Total Expenses Thru 09/30/2016	2.28
Total Current Work	72.28

Payments

09/23/2016 Payment -1,151.72

Balance Due \$72.28