

Michael R. Kenyon
Rachel B. Turpin
Ann Marie J. Soto
John P. Long, Jr.
Kim Adams Pratt
Robert F. Noe
David A. Linehan
Amy S. Mill
Charlotte A. Archer



Bruce L. Disend
Doug F. Mosich
Of Counsel
Shelley M. Kerslake
2015

RECEIVED JUL 10 2015

July 7, 2015

City of Gold Bar
107 – 5th Street
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: June 2015 Billing

General City Attorney Services (269.000)	32.00
Block 1 v. City of Gold Bar (269.102)	1811.68
Block3 v. City of Gold Bar (269.110)	<u>222.50</u>

Current Month's Charges **\$2066.18**

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Linda Loen
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
June 30, 2015
Account No: 269-00000M
Statement No: 183077

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Previous Balance \$33.61

Fees

		Hours	
06/04/2015 AMS	Telephone call to and from L. Loen related to various City matters.	0.20	
	For Current Services Rendered	0.20	32.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	0.20	\$160.00

Total Current Work 32.00

Payments

06/22/2015 Payment -33.61

Balance Due \$32.00

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
 Attn: Mayor Linda Loen
 107 - 5th Street
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
 June 30, 2015
 Account No: 269-10200M
 Statement No: 183078

Block1 v. City of Gold Bar
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED

Previous Balance \$554.30

Fees

			Hours
06/03/2015	KIS	Review incoming discovery requests; calendar deadlines for response; meet with attorneys regarding case plan; e-mail draft to attorneys for review.	0.50
	AMS	E-mails to and from M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer related to discovery requests.	0.20
06/04/2015	AMS	Telephone call to L. Loen related to case status.	0.20
06/09/2015	AMS	Review and revise discovery requests; e-mail to K. Swoyer related to same.	0.60
06/10/2015	KIS	Review and format discovery requests.	0.90
06/11/2015	MRK	Receive/review e-mails regarding discovery; conference with A. Soto regarding City's responses to Block's discovery; review City's draft discovery requests.	0.60
	AMS	Review Block's discovery; meeting with M. Kenyon related to same; research court rules.	0.90
06/12/2015	KIS	Finalize discovery requests to plaintiff.	0.50
06/18/2015	AMS	Meeting with L. Loen related to discovery requests.	1.40
06/26/2015	AMS	Prepare responses to discovery.	1.20
	KIS	Draft discovery responses and responses to admissions for A. Soto review.	0.80
06/29/2015	AMS	Draft answers to interrogatories and requests for admissions; e-mail to and from M. Kenyon related to same.	1.10
06/30/2015	AMS	Telephone calls to C. Beyer, J. Myers and L. Loen related to discovery; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; review and revise draft answers to discovery requests; e-mail to A. Block related to depositions.	2.80
		For Current Services Rendered	11.70
			1,804.50

Block1 v. City of Gold Bar
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED

Recapitulation		Hours	Rate
<u>Timekeeper</u>			
Michael R. Kenyon		0.60	\$295.00
Ann Marie Soto		8.40	160.00
Kathy I. Swoyer		2.70	105.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	3.90
Postage	3.28
Total Expenses Thru 06/30/2015	7.18
Total Current Work	1,811.68

Payments

06/22/2015	Payment	-554.30
	Balance Due	<u>\$1,811.68</u>

City of Gold Bar
 Attn: Mayor Linda Loen
 107 - 5th Street
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
 June 30, 2015
 Account No: 269-11000M
 Statement No: 183079

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

		Hours	
06/22/2015	KIS Review incoming Court of Appeals opinion; calendar deadlines regarding same.	0.40	
	AMS Receive and review COA decision; telephone calls to K. Swoyer and L. Loen related to same.	0.80	
06/24/2015	KIS E-mail from and M. Kenyon regarding cost bill; assemble costs; insert amounts into cost bill; e-mail to bookkeeper regarding additional fees.	0.50	
	For Current Services Rendered	1.70	222.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	0.80	\$160.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	0.90	105.00

Total Current Work 222.50

Balance Due \$222.50