



Michael R. Kenyon  
Bruce L. Disend  
Shelley M. Kerslake  
Kari L. Sand  
Chris D. Bacha  
Rachel B. Turpin  
Ann Marie J. Soto  
John P. Long, Jr.  
Danielle M. Evans  
Kim Adams Pratt

RECEIVED NOV 07 2014

A handwritten mark, possibly initials or a signature, located to the right of the received stamp.

November 6, 2014

City of Gold Bar  
107 – 5<sup>th</sup> Street  
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: October 2014 Billing

General City Attorney Services (269.000)	375.00
Block 3 v. City of Gold Bar (269.110)	<u>1287.00</u>
<b>Current Month's Charges</b>	<b>\$1,662.00</b>

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Linda Loen  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 October 31, 2014  
 Account No: 269-00000M  
 Statement No: 182247

General City Attorney Services  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<b>Previous Balance</b>	<b>\$60.00</b>
-------------------------	----------------

Fees

		Hours	
10/17/2014 AMS	Telephone call from D. Beaston related to marijuana business issues.	0.30	
10/20/2014 AMS	Research code related to CUPs and business licenses; telephone conference with D. Beaston, J. Light and B. Strom related to same.	0.80	
10/21/2014 AMS	Review and revise CUP permit application; research code related to same; e-mail to and from D. Beaston related to same.	0.90	
10/27/2014 AMS	Telephone call from L. Loen related to litigation update and marijuana regulations.	0.50	
	For Current Services Rendered	2.50	375.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	2.50	\$150.00

Total Current Work	375.00
--------------------	--------

Payments

10/23/2014	Payment	-60.00
------------	---------	--------

<b>Balance Due</b>	<b><u>\$375.00</u></b>
--------------------	------------------------

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Linda Loen  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 October 31, 2014  
 Account No: 269-11000M  
 Statement No: 182248

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

**Previous Balance** \$396.56

Fees

		Hours	
10/09/2014	MRK Review and respond to e-mails from T. Lay regarding procedural issues.	0.60	
10/13/2014	AMS E-mails to and from M. Kenyon related to amicus brief.	0.20	
10/14/2014	AMS E-mails and telephone calls to and from M. Kenyon and B. Strom related to amicus brief; research statutes, court rules and case law related to same.	2.00	
10/15/2014	KIS Review incoming Court of Appeals ruling granting motion for amicus brief; prepare calendar regarding deadline for response brief and notify attorneys regarding same; draft template for response to amicus and e-mail same to A. Soto.	0.80	
	AMS E-mail to L. Loen related to amicus brief; e-mails to and from K. Swoyer and M. Kenyon related to same.	0.30	
10/16/2014	KIS Prepare working copies of amicus brief to attorneys; update M. Kenyon appeal notebook.	0.40	
10/22/2014	AMS Review Brief of Amici.	0.40	
10/23/2014	MRK Conference with A. Soto regarding outline and issues for City's Response to Amicus Brief.	0.30	
	AMS Meeting with M. Kenyon related to Answer to Brief of Amici; research statutes and case law.	3.00	
10/27/2014	AMS Telephone call to and from J. Meyers related to lawsuit [NO CHARGE].	0.10	
10/29/2014	AMS Telephone call from J. Meyers related to appeal.	0.20	
	For Current Services Rendered	8.30	1,287.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Michael R. Kenyon	0.90	\$280.00
Ann Marie Soto	0.10	0.00
Ann Marie Soto	6.10	150.00

City of Gold Bar

Page: 2  
October 31, 2014  
Account No: 269-11000M  
Statement No: 182248

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Kathy I. Swoyer	1.20	100.00

Total Current Work 1,287.00

Payments

10/23/2014 Payment -396.56

**Balance Due** \$1,287.00