



Kari L. Sand Chris D. Bacha Bob C. Sterbank Rachel B. Turpin Ann Marie J. Soto John P. Long, Jr. Nicole L. Hay

September 6, 2013

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 – 5th Street Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: August 2013 Billing

General City Attorney Services (269.000) Block3 v. Gold Bar (269.110) 98.70 12611.34

Current Month's Charges

\$12,710.04



KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar

Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers

107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1
August 31, 2013
Account No: 269-0000M
Statement No: 17909

General City Attorney Services FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

	<u> </u>				
00 (00 (00 0				Hours	
08/02/2013 AMS	/02/2013 AMS E-mail from J. Beavers related to marijuana license inquiry [NO CHARGE].				
08/15/2013 AMS	Telephone call from J. Beavers related to various city matters [NO CHARGE].				
08/20/2013 AMS	Telephone call from J. Beavers related to meeting [NO CHARGE].				
08/22/2013 AMS	Meeting with J. Beavers regarding various city matters and PRRs.				
08/27/2013 AMS	Discussion with M. Kenyon related to PRRs; meeting with J. Beavers related to same. For Current Services Rendered			0.30	87.00
Recapitulation					
	Timekeeper Ann Marie Soto Ann Marie Soto	Hours 0.30 0.60	Rate \$0.00 145.00		
Expenses					
	Photocopy charges				11.70
Total Expenses Thru 08/31/2013					11.70
	Total Current Work				98.70
	Previous Balance				\$408.07
	Balance Due				\$506.77

KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1
August 31, 2013
Account No: 269-11000M
Statement No: 17910

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

	08/08/2013	AMS	E-mail from W. Crittenden related to Block's	Hours
			Response and Reply; review pleadings related to same; e-mail to M. Kenyon related to same.	1.20
	08/09/2013	AMS	Discussion with M. Kenyon related to Block's Response and Reply.	0.20
		KIS	Review incoming response/reply to cross-summary judgment motions and meet with A. Soto regarding same [NO CHARGE].	0.30
	08/11/2013	AMS	Research case law related to City's Reply; draft Reply.	2.10
	08/12/2013	AMS	Draft Reply.	1.00
	08/13/2013	MRK	Receive/review Block's response/reply regarding cross-motions for summary judgment, related	1.50
	ALK	conference with A. Soto and A. Kenyon. Meeting with A. Soto and M. Kenyon regarding case		
		MAS	strategy [NO CHARGE]. Update file.	0.60
		AMS	Draft City's Reply to Cross-Motion; research case law related to same; e-mail to M. Kenyon related to same.	5.30
	00/14/2012	14D75		0100
	08/14/2013	MKK	Review and edit City's Summary Judgment Reply Brief, related review of Summary Judgment record and	
	ALK	conduct legal research. Review City's Summary Judgment Reply brief [NO	6.40	
		CHARGE].	0.40	
	08/15/2013	MRK	Additional edits to City's Reply Brief, related	3.10
	ALK	review of record and legal research. Review M. Kenyon's edits to City's Reply Brief [NO CHARGE]. Review/edit/comment upon City's Reply Brief for		
	MCS			
		Review and revise Reply to Cross-Motion; research case law related to same; review transcript related to same; draft declaration related to same;	1.70	

City of Gold Bar

Page: 2 August 31, 2013

Account No: 269-11000M Statement No: 17910

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

O8/16/2013 MAS Prepare and mark exhibits to Beavers Reply Declaration; prepare and send revised declaration and exhibits to J. Beavers; discuss revisions with A. Soto. MRK Additional review of City's Reply Brief and related exhibits, brief conference with A. Soto. MCS Proof and edit J. Beavers Reply Declaration in Support of Motion for Summary Judgment; proof and edit new draft of Reply brief. AMS Review and revise Reply to Cross-Motion and related declaration; e-mails to and from J. Beavers related to same; telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to same; discussions with M. Kenyon, M. Starkey and M. Swan related to same; e-mails to and from M. Kenyon and M. Starkey related to same; research case law related to same; review records related to same. O8/19/2013 MRK Final review and edits to City's Reply Brief, related review of declarations and exhibits; conference with K. Swoyer regarding final edits and service/filing. MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. O8/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary judgment hearing; e-mails from court and W.	40
A. Soto. MRK Additional review of City's Reply Brief and related exhibits, brief conference with A. Soto. MCS Proof and edit J. Beavers Reply Declaration in Support of Motion for Summary Judgment; proof and edit new draft of Reply brief. AMS Review and revise Reply to Cross-Motion and related declaration; e-mails to and from J. Beavers related to same; telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to same; telephone calls to same; e-mails to and from M. Kenyon, M. Starkey and M. Swan related to same; e-mails to and from M. Kenyon and M. Starkey related to same; research case law related to same; review records related to same. 08/19/2013 MRK Final review and edits to City's Reply Brief, related review of declarations and exhibits; conference with K. Swoyer regarding final edits and service/filing. MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. 08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	40
exhibits, brief conference with A. Soto. Proof and edit J. Beavers Reply Declaration in Support of Motion for Summary Judgment; proof and edit new draft of Reply brief. AMS Review and revise Reply to Cross-Motion and related declaration; e-mails to and from J. Beavers related to same; telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to same; discussions with M. Kenyon, M. Starkey and M. Swan related to same; e-mails to and from M. Kenyon and M. Starkey related to same; research case law related to same; review records related to same. 08/19/2013 MRK Final review and edits to City's Reply Brief, related review of declarations and exhibits; conference with K. Swoyer regarding final edits and service/filing. MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. 08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	
edit new draft of Reply brief. Review and revise Reply to Cross-Motion and related declaration; e-mails to and from J. Beavers related to same; telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to same; discussions with M. Kenyon, M. Starkey and M. Swan related to same; e-mails to and from M. Kenyon and M. Starkey related to same; research case law related to same; review records related to same. 08/19/2013 MRK Final review and edits to City's Reply Brief, related review of declarations and exhibits; conference with K. Swoyer regarding final edits and service/filing. MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. 08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	20
related review of declarations and exhibits; conference with K. Swoyer regarding final edits and service/filing. MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. C8/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	90
MCS Proof and edit revised final draft of Reply Brief; finalize same; meet with M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer regarding same. 2.2 KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. 2.4 08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	40
regarding same. KIS Review, format and finalize Reply Brief and J. Beavers declaration for filing and service; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; telephone call to and from A. Soto regarding same; update attorney hearing notebook; e-mail Reply Brief to opposing counsel. 2.2 08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	30
08/20/2013 AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary	
	10
Crittenden related to same. 0.2	20
KIS Confirm hearing regarding 08.23.13 summary judgment motion.	
08/21/2013 MRK Begin review of summary judgment briefing,	
declarations and exhibits, and cited cases in preparation for summary judgment hearing.	30
MAS Revise order granting city's motion for summary judgment.	40
08/22/2013 MRK Continue review and preparation for summary judgment hearing. 8.7	70
AMS Discussion with M. Kenyon related to summary judgment hearing.	40
08/23/2013 MRK Prepare for and argue cross-motions for summary judgment and motion for in-camera review. 6.1	10
AMS Travel to and attend summary judgment hearing at Snohomish County Superior Court [NO CHARGE]. 3.0	
08/27/2013 AMS Meeting with J. Beavers related to records for in	

City of Gold Bar

Page: 3 August 31, 2013

Account No: 269-11000M Statement No: 17910

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

					Hours	
	camera review; review records related to same; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; e-mail to W. Crittenden related to same; draft letter to court related to same; prepare records for transmittal to					
	court; e-mail to M. Keny	court; e-mail to M. Kenyon related to same.				
08/28/2013 AM	E-mails to and from M. Kenyon, W. Crittenden and J. Berry related to in camera review; research court rules related to same.					
08/29/2013 MR	Review e-mails from A. Soto and W. Crittenden; review draft transmittal letter and documents for in-camera review; telephone call to A. Soto.				0.40	
AM	S Telephone call from M. F review [NO CHARGE].	Kenyon related t	o in cam	nera	0.10	
	For Current Services Ren	ndered				2,055.00
	Re	ecapitulation				
	Timekeeper Michael R. Kenyon Ann Marie Soto Ann Marie Soto Margaret C. Starkey Mary A. Swan Alexandra L. Kenyon Kathy I. Swoyer Kathy I. Swoyer		Hours 30.30 3.10 19.60 6.10 1.20 1.70 0.30 2.60	Rate \$270.00 0.00 145.00 110.00 95.00 0.00 0.00 95.00		
		Expenses				
	Photocopy charges Postage Westlaw Computer Researd Total Expenses Thru 08/3					62.85 2.72 409.12 474.69
<u>Advances</u>						
	Courier/Messenger fees					81.65
	Total Advances Thru 08/3	31/2013				81.65
	Total Current Work				1	2,611.34
	Previous Balance				\$2	2,104.95
	Balance Due				\$3	4,716.29