

FOSTER PEPPER PLLC

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

1111 THIRD AVENUE SUITE 3400

SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98101

206-447-4400

TAX ID. #91-0606972

Client No. 71446

June 22, 2009
Invoice No. 923259

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Crystal Hill
107 5th Street
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Matter No. 3

v. Block

Total Current Charges	\$8,761.50	
Current Interest Charge	\$0.00	
Previously Billed Invoices Outstanding as of June 22, 2009	\$0.00 *	
Total Due As Of June 22, 2009	<table border="1"><tr><td>\$8,761.50</td></tr></table>	\$8,761.50
\$8,761.50		

Payments received after the above date are not reflected on this statement
*If you need additional information re these invoices please call (206) 447-5913

PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT. PAYMENT DUE IN U.S. DOLLARS UPON RECEIPT OF INVOICE.
MAKE CHECK PAYABLE TO FOSTER PEPPER PLLC AND SEND TO ABOVE ADDRESS
ALL AMOUNTS 30 DAYS PAST DUE SHALL ACCRUE INTEREST AT 12% PER ANNUM.
WE ACCEPT VISA AND MASTERCARD

FOSTER PEPPER PLLC

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

1111 THIRD AVENUE SUITE 3400

SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98101

206-447-4400

TAX ID. #91-0606972

Client No. 71446

June 22, 2009
Invoice No. 923259City of Gold Bar
Attn: Crystal Hill
107 5th Street
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Matter No. 3

v. Block

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
04/17/09	R. Ramerman	Meeting with mayor re Anne Block PRA requests; review issues related to case	1.4	413.00
04/21/09	R. Ramerman	Review pleadings and correspondence	1.1	324.50
04/24/09	R. Ramerman	Travel to and from Snohomish to meet with Cheryl Beyer; review cases and documents; discuss case strategy	2.5	737.50
04/26/09	R. Ramerman	Draft letter and notice of association; prepare document collection chart	1.3	383.50
04/28/09	R. Ramerman	Address strategy issues for handling communications; review case law regarding discovery; revise and complete letter regarding notice of appearance	1.1	324.50
05/05/09	R. Ramerman	Prepare for council meeting; attend executive session on Block litigation; travel to and from Gold Bar	3.4	1,003.00
05/11/09	R. Ramerman	Email correspondence with client re executive session; address issues related to PRA requests	0.8	236.00
05/12/09	R. Ramerman	Teleconference with Bill Crittenden re issues related to document production; teleconference with Cheryl Byer re litigation	2.1	619.50
05/13/09	R. Ramerman	Prepare for executive session; email correspondence regarding call with Bill Crittenden	0.8	236.00

FOSTER PEPPER V.L.L.C.

Client No. 71446

Page: 2

June 22, 2009

v. Block

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
05/14/09	R. Ramerman	Prepare for executive session; attend executive session; discuss litigation strategy with client; travel to and from Gold Bar	7.9	2,330.50
05/15/09	R. Ramerman	Address follow-up issues related to executive session	0.8	236.00
05/18/09	R. Ramerman	Email correspondence regarding additional public records requests related to Anne Block; review issues related to requests	1.1	324.50
05/19/09	R. Ramerman	Teleconference regarding judicial assignments; review public records requests; teleconference regarding litigation issues	1.4	413.00
05/20/09	R. Ramerman	Email correspondence regarding litigation; drafting and research regarding litigation	1.9	560.50
05/26/09	R. Ramerman	Address issues related to judicial assignments; research legal issues	1.1	324.50
05/29/09	R. Ramerman	Address issues related to PRA request for blackberry	1.0	295.00
		Total Hours	29.7	
		TOTAL FOR LEGAL SERVICES		\$8,761.50
		TOTAL AMOUNT DUE		\$8,761.50