



Michael R. Kenyon  
Bruce L. Disend  
Shelley M. Kerslake

---

Kari L. Sand  
Chris D. Bacha  
Margaret J. King  
Bob C. Sterbank  
Rachel B. Turpin  
Ann Marie J. Soto

June 8, 2012

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 – 5<sup>th</sup> Street  
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: May 2012 Billing

|  |               |
|--|---------------|
| General City Attorney Services (269.000)         | 1400.25       |
| Forbes v. Gold Bar (269.100)                     | 554.60        |
| Block2 v. Gold Bar (269.103)                     | 33.10         |
| Block v. Gold Bar OPMA Violation Claim (269.106) | 9071.80       |
| Recall Petition 2 (269.107)                      | 370.22        |
| Recall Petition 3 (269.108)                      | 4682.85       |
| New Cingular Wireless (269.200)                  | <u>115.32</u> |

**Current Month's Charges** **\$16,228.14**

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-00000M  
Statement No: 15988

General City Attorney Services  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |   | Hours |                 |
|------------|-----|---|-------|-----------------|
| 05/01/2012 | MJK | Review PRRs.  | 0.20  |                 |
|            | AMS | Multiple telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to council meeting; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; discussion with M. King related to same; e-mail from J. Beavers related to same. | 1.60  |                 |
| 05/02/2012 | MJK | Review PRRs.  | 0.80  |                 |
| 05/03/2012 | KIS | Review incoming e-mails regarding general city matters and update files regarding same.   | 0.30  |                 |
| 05/04/2012 | AMS | Multiple e-mails from M. Kenyon related to A. Block; multiple e-mails from J. Beavers related to PRRs; telephone call from J. Beavers related to same.  | 0.70  |                 |
| 05/07/2012 | AMS | Telephone call to and from J. Beavers related to meeting; e-mail to and from M. Kenyon and M. King related to same.   | 0.20  |                 |
| 05/09/2012 | MJK | Meet with M. Kenyon and A. Soto regarding litigation; meet with Mayor regarding litigation; review e-mails.   | 1.70  |                 |
|            | AMS | Meeting with J. Beavers, M. Kenyon and M. King related to lawsuits.   | 1.20  |                 |
| 05/16/2012 | KIS | Organize e-mails regarding and documents regarding general city matters for files.  | 0.30  |                 |
| 05/22/2012 | AMS | Review ILAs related to drug task force, prosecution, and jail transport services; e-mail to L. Kelly related to same; telephone call from J. Beavers related to same.                                   | 1.60  |                 |
| 05/23/2012 | KIS | Prepare and organize miscellaneous documents for city files.  | 0.30  |                 |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered   | 8.90  | <u>1,390.50</u> |

General City Attorney Services  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u> | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Ann Marie Soto    | 5.30         | \$135.00    |
| Margaret J. King  | 2.70         | 220.00      |
| Kathy I. Swoyer   | 0.90         | 90.00       |

Expenses

|                                |                       |
|--------------------------------|-----------------------|
| Photocopy charges              | 8.85                  |
| Postage                        | <u>0.90</u>           |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | 9.75                  |
| <br>Total Current Work         | <br>1,400.25          |
| <br><b>Previous Balance</b>    | <br><b>\$2,055.15</b> |

Payments

|            |                        |                              |
|------------|------------------------|------------------------------|
| 06/07/2012 | Payment                | -2,055.15                    |
|            | <br><b>Balance Due</b> | <br><b><u>\$1,400.25</u></b> |

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 May 31, 2012  
 Account No: 269-10000M  
 Statement No: 15989

Forbes vs. Gold Bar  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |   | Hours |        |
|------------|-----|---|-------|--------|
| 05/04/2012 | KIS | Telephone call from Court of Appeals regarding deadlines and confirming same.   | 0.20  |        |
| 05/21/2012 | KIS | Organize file in preparation for Appeal Hearing; continue to work on M. King notebook regarding same; update pleadings index. | 0.50  |        |
| 05/31/2012 | KIS | Continue to compile, prepare and organize documents and research for M. King notebook in preparation for oral argument.       | 2.00  |        |
|            | MJK | Review pleadings to prepare for oral argument.  | 1.40  |        |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered   | 4.10  | 551.00 |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u> | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Margaret J. King  | 1.40         | \$220.00    |
| Kathy I. Swoyer   | 2.70         | 90.00       |

Expenses

|                                |                |
|--------------------------------|----------------|
| Photocopy charges              | 3.15           |
| Facsimile costs                | 0.45           |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | 3.60           |
| Total Current Work             | 554.60         |
| <b>Previous Balance</b>        | <b>\$29.55</b> |

Payments

|            |                    |                 |
|------------|--------------------|-----------------|
| 06/07/2012 | Payment            | -29.55          |
|            | <b>Balance Due</b> | <b>\$554.60</b> |

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-10300M  
Statement No: 15990

Block2 v. Gold Bar  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Expenses

|                                |              |
|--------------------------------|--------------|
| Westlaw Computer Research      | 33.10        |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | <u>33.10</u> |
| Total Current Work             | 33.10        |
| <b>Previous Balance</b>        | \$2,577.07   |

Payments

|            |                    |                |
|------------|--------------------|----------------|
| 06/07/2012 | Payment            | -2,577.07      |
|            | <b>Balance Due</b> | <u>\$33.10</u> |

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-10600M  
Statement No: 15991

Block v. City of Gold Bar OPMA Violation Claim  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |   | Hours |
|------------|---|-------|
| 05/02/2012 | MRK Telephone call from G. Overstreet regarding attorney fees and confession of judgment; e-mail from G. Overstreet; brief related conference with A. Soto and M. King.   | 0.30  |
| 05/04/2012 | MRK E-mail from G. Overstreet; e-mail to Mayor and related conference with A. Soto.   | 0.40  |
|            | KIS Review and organize e-mails regarding case plan.  | 0.20  |
|            | AMS Multiple discussions with M. Kenyon related to lawsuit; e-mail from M. Kenyon related to same; telephone call from J. Beavers related to same; research statutes related to same; discussion with M. King related to same; e-mail to M. Kenyon and M. King related to same.                   | 1.30  |
| 05/07/2012 | MRK E-mail exchange and brief related conference with A. Soto; legal research regarding Mayor's spending authority; draft and revise e-mail to G. Overstreet.   | 0.70  |
|            | AMS Multiple discussions with M. Kenyon related to lawsuit; research statutes related to same; multiple e-mails from M. Kenyon related to same.   | 1.40  |
| 05/09/2012 | MRK Exchange e-mails with G. Overstreet regarding discovery and related issues; conference with A. Soto and M. King regarding litigation strategy, related conference with Mayor Beavers, A. Soto, and M. King.   | 1.30  |
| 05/14/2012 | MRK Receive/review multiple deposition subpoenas and SDTs, related conference with M. King and A. Soto; e-mail to G. Overstreet regarding CR 26(i) conference.  | 0.50  |
|            | KIS Prepare documents for M. King review regarding upcoming motions; update caption.  | 0.60  |
|            | AMS Multiple discussions with M. Kenyon and M. King related to depositions and motion for protective order; research statutes, court rules, and case law related to same; draft motion related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same; multiple e-mails from J. Beavers related to |       |

Block v. City of Gold Bar OPMA Violation Claim  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |   | Hours |
|------------|---|-------|
|            | same.   | 7.50  |
|            | MJK Draft motion for pre-assignment; draft motion and declarations for protective order; research regarding same.   | 2.20  |
| 05/15/2012 | MRK Conference with A. Soto regarding City's motion for protective order, receive/review Audit report regarding litigation expenditures; e-mail to G. Overstreet regarding CR 26(i) conference.   | 0.50  |
|            | AMS Draft motion for protective order; review and edit declarations; multiple discussions with M. Kenyon and M. King related to same; research statutes, court rules, and case law related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same.   | 4.60  |
| 05/16/2012 | MRK Initial review of City's motion for protective order, related e-mail to G. Overstreet.  | 0.40  |
|            | KIS Prepare calendar regarding depositions and notify attorneys regarding same; prepare attorney e-mails for files; update pleadings file and index; meet with M. Kenyon regarding status of CR 26 conference.  | 1.80  |
|            | MJK Research regarding protective order; review and revise draft regarding same; draft declaration of M. King   | 2.40  |
|            | AMS Multiple discussions with M. Kenyon and M. King related to motion for protective order; revise motion and declarations related to same; research statutes, court rules, and case law related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same.   | 1.00  |
| 05/18/2012 | MRK Receive/review and revise City's motion for protective order and related declarations, related legal research; telephone call from G. Overstreet for CR 26 conference; revise City's proposed Order.  | 5.30  |
|            | MCS Meet with M. Kenyon regarding Motion for Protective Order and remaining associated tasks; review Snohomish County local rules regarding certificate of compliance; draft Declaration of M. Kenyon and Certificate of Compliance; proof and edit Motion for Protective Order; draft Proposed Protective Order.   | 2.70  |
|            | KIS Review, format and finalize Motion for Protective Order and declarations; verify citations in brief; draft calendar note; prepare certificate of service; meet with M. Kenyon regarding e-service; e-mail documents to opposing counsel.  | 1.90  |
|            | AMS Multiple discussions with M. Kenyon and M. King related to motion for protective order; multiple e-mails from M. Kenyon and K. Swoyer related to same; telephone call from K. Ware related to same; multiple telephone calls to and from J. Beavers related to same; discussion with K. Swoyer related to same. | 1.50  |

Block v. City of Gold Bar OPMA Violation Claim  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |            |   | Hours   |
|------------|------------|---|---|
| 05/21/2012 | KIS        | Update and organize file; revise calendar note and e-mail to opposing counsel; calendar deadlines for responsive pleadings and hearing regarding motion for protective order.   | 2.60  |
| 05/22/2012 | MRK        | E-mail to G. Overstreet regarding deposition scheduling; conference with A. Soto regarding discovery and Summary Judgment issues.   | 0.30  |
| 05/23/2012 | KIS        | Review incoming response from plaintiffs to motion for protective order; update pleadings and index regarding same.   | 0.40  |
|            | BCS        | Legal research and draft reply on motion for protective order.  | 3.00  |
|            | AMS        | Review response to motion for protective order; telephone call to M. King related to same.  | 0.20  |
| 05/24/2012 | MJK        | Research and draft Reply to Response to Motion for Protective Order and for Stay.   | 4.40  |
|            | BCS        | Complete legal research and draft reply on motion for protective order regarding standard of review and federal cases regarding same.   | 4.00  |
|            | MRK        | Review and revise City's Reply regarding Protective Order, related legal research.  | 1.30  |
|            | KIS        | Update deadlines for depositions on firm calendar; confirm hearing for motion for protective order; notify attorneys and make preparations to comply with deadlines; update files.  | 1.30  |
|            | AMS        | Telephone call from M. King related to reply to motion for protective order; discussion with M. Kenyon and M. King related to same.   | 0.60  |
|            | 05/25/2012 | MCS   | Proof, edit and finalize Reply on Motion for Protective Order and Declaration of A. Soto. |
| 05/25/2012 | KIS        | Multiple e-mails from and to attorneys regarding finalizing brief and declaration; finalize brief and declaration for filing and service; prepare declaration of service for filing and e-mail same to opposing counsel; compile and prepare documents to assist attorneys. | 2.40  |
|            | MRK        | Review and revise final versions of City's Reply regarding Protective Order and Soto Declaration, related legal research.   | 1.80  |
|            | AMS        | Revise reply to motion for protective order; discussion with M. King related to same; draft declaration related to same; multiple e-mails from M. Kenyon and M. King related to same; discussion with M. Starkey related to same.   | 3.70  |
| 05/29/2012 | MRK        | Review briefing and cited cases, prepare for and argue Motion for Protective Order, follow-up conference with A. Soto and Mayor Beavers.  | 4.50  |
|            | AMS        | In court for hearing on motion for protective order; discussion with M. Kenyon and J. Beavers related to same; e-mail to G. Overstreet related  |   |

Block v. City of Gold Bar OPMA Violation Claim  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |     |  | Hours |           |
|------------|-----|--|-------|-----------|
|            |     | to same; discussion with M. King related to same.  | 1.50  |           |
|            | AMS | Travel to Snohomish County Courthouse for hearing on motion for protective order.  | 1.40  |           |
|            | MRK | Travel to and from Snohomish County Courthouse for Motion Hearing.   | 1.40  |           |
| 05/30/2012 | KIS | Meet with A. Soto and M. Kenyon regarding result of 5/29/12 hearing; prepare calendar regarding motion for summary judgment.             | 0.40  |           |
| 05/31/2012 | MRK | Legal research regarding necessary parties for litigation, related conference with A. Soto regarding summary judgment arguments.         | 0.40  |           |
|            | AMS | Meeting with M. Kenyon related to summary judgment motion; telephone call to M. King related to same; research case law related to same. | 5.50  |           |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered  | 82.70 | 13,819.50 |
|            |     | City of Kent Contribution Up To Withdrawl  |       | -5,000.00 |
|            |     | Net fees after Community Contribution  |       | 8,819.50  |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u>   | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|---------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Michael R. Kenyon   | 1.40         | \$75.00     |
| Michael R. Kenyon   | 17.70        | 255.00      |
| Ann Marie Soto      | 1.40         | 75.00       |
| Ann Marie Soto      | 28.80        | 135.00      |
| Margaret C. Starkey | 5.80         | 105.00      |
| Margaret J. King    | 9.00         | 220.00      |
| Kathy I. Swoyer     | 11.60        | 90.00       |
| Bob C. Sterbank     | 7.00         | 225.00      |

Expenses

|                                |       |
|--------------------------------|-------|
| Photocopy charges              | 47.40 |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | 47.40 |

Advances

|                                |        |
|--------------------------------|--------|
| Courier/Messenger fees         | 204.90 |
| Total Advances Thru 05/31/2012 | 204.90 |

Total Current Work 9,071.80

**Previous Balance** \$330.42

Payments

06/07/2012 Payment -330.42

**Balance Due** \$9,071.80

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 May 31, 2012  
 Account No: 269-10700M  
 Statement No: 15992

Recall Petition 2  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |   | Hours |        |
|------------|-----|---|-------|--------|
| 05/02/2012 | KIS | Regarding appeal of Wright petition, analyze initial file materials to determine disputed issues, identify parties and prepare distribution lists; retrieve case status information from court dockets; prepare case maintenance systems; prepare case information form; prepare pleadings index; update and organize file. | 1.70  |        |
| 05/04/2012 | KIS | Review designated clerk's papers and compare with court docket; update pleadings and index.   | 0.40  |        |
| 05/21/2012 | MAS | Index pleadings and prepare case information sheets for both Beavers and Martin recall files; organize files and update pleadings index for the Wright recall file.   | 1.30  |        |
|            | AMS | E-mails to and from A. Block related to dismissal orders; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same.  | 0.20  |        |
| 05/22/2012 | AMS | E-mail to and from A. Block related to dismissal orders [NO CHARGE].  | 0.10  |        |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered   | 3.70  | 333.00 |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u> | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Ann Marie Soto    | 0.10         | \$0.00      |
| Ann Marie Soto    | 0.20         | 135.00      |
| Mary A. Swan      | 1.30         | 90.00       |
| Kathy I. Swoyer   | 2.10         | 90.00       |

Expenses

|                                |        |
|--------------------------------|--------|
| Photocopy charges              | 8.25   |
| Westlaw Computer Research      | 28.97  |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | 37.22  |
| Total Current Work             | 370.22 |

City of Gold Bar

Page: 2

May 31, 2012

Account No: 269-10700M

Statement No: 15992

Recall Petition 2  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

**Previous Balance** \$5,472.22

Payments

06/07/2012 Payment -5,472.22

**Balance Due** \$370.22

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-10800M  
Statement No: 15993

Recall Petition 3  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |  | Hours |
|------------|-----|--|-------|
| 05/02/2012 | KIS | Regarding new recall petition of J. Beavers, analyze initial file materials to determine disputed issues, identify parties and prepare distribution lists; prepare case maintenance systems; prepare case information form; prepare pleadings index; update files; meet with A. Soto regarding case plan; compile documents per A. Soto request. | 0.90  |
|            | AMS | Multiple discussions with M. King related to recall petition; telephone call to and from J. Beavers related to same; discussion with K. Swoyer related to same; research statutes related to same; telephone call from M. King related to same.  | 1.20  |
| 05/07/2012 | AMS | E-mail to G. Sivley related to recall hearing scheduling [NO CHARGE].  | 0.10  |
| 05/08/2012 | AMS | Research case law related to recall petitions.   | 0.20  |
| 05/10/2012 | AMS | Research statutes and case law related to recalls.   | 0.50  |
| 05/11/2012 | AMS | Research statutes and case law related to recalls; discussion with M. King related to same.  | 1.50  |
| 05/14/2012 | KIS | Analyze incoming ballot synopsis to determine disputed issues, identify parties and prepare distribution lists; prepare case maintenance systems; update case information form; prepare pleadings index; prepare caption for pleadings; prepare notice of appearance for filing and service.   | 1.80  |
| 05/16/2012 | KIS | Telephone call to and from court reporter regarding status of request for transcript of previous proceeding.   | 0.30  |
|            | AMS | Research case law related to recalls.  | 0.70  |
| 05/17/2012 | AMS | E-mail to and from S. Forbes and C. Lie related to service [NO CHARGE].  | 0.10  |

Recall Petition 3  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |     |  | Hours |
|------------|-----|--|-------|
| 05/18/2012 | MAS | Scan pleadings to client file.   | 0.20  |
|            | AMS | Draft response to recall petition; draft declaration related to same; e-mail to and from S. Forbes and C. Lie related to same; multiple discussions with M. King related to same; research case law related to same.   | 4.00  |
| 05/21/2012 | MJK | Review and revise declarations; and draft response of Mayor; conference with A. Soto regarding same.   | 2.90  |
|            | MAS | Review and finalize declaration of J. Beavers; begin reviewing response.   | 2.50  |
|            | AMS | Draft response to recall petition; e-mail to M. King related to same; e-mail to J. Beavers related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same; e-mail to G. Sivley related to electronic service; e-mail to M. Swan related to same; discussion with M. King related to same. | 4.50  |
| 05/22/2012 | MAS | Review and finalize response and declaration of A. Soto; review and finalize proposed order; prepare documents for filing with the court, delivery of working copies and service on opposing parties; update pleadings file; prepare working copy binder for A. Soto.                    | 3.00  |
|            | AMS | Telephone calls to J. Beavers related to recall response; discussion with M. Swan related to same; revise pleadings related to same; discussion with M. King related to same; e-mail to and from G. Sivley related to same.  | 1.00  |
| 05/23/2012 | MJK | Conference with A. Soto,   | 0.30  |
|            | AMS | Prepare for recall hearing oral argument; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same.  | 1.80  |
| 05/24/2012 | AMS | In court for recall hearing; discussion with M. Kenyon and M. King related to same; e-mail to K. Jensen related to same.   | 2.10  |
|            | AMS | Travel to and from Snohomish County Courthouse for recall hearing.   | 1.40  |
| 05/25/2012 | AMS | Multiple e-mails to and from K. Jensen and S. Forbes related to order of dismissal.  | 0.20  |
| 05/30/2012 | KIS | Review e-mail regarding court reporter for 5/24/12 hearing; telephone call to court reporter regarding transcript of hearing.  | 0.20  |
|            | AMS | Discussion with M. Kenyon related to appeal; e-mail to J. Beavers related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same.   | 0.20  |
| 05/31/2012 | KIS | Telephone calls to and from court reporter regarding hearing transcript; e-mail from court reporter regarding same and enclosing invoice for same; prepare letter to court reporter enclosing check and requesting transcript; update files.   | 1.00  |

Recall Petition 3  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|   | Hours |          |
|---|-------|----------|
| AMS E-mail to and from A. Block related to consolidation of appeals in J. Beavers and C. Wright recall matters; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same. | 0.20  |          |
| For Current Services Rendered   | 32.80 | 4,143.50 |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u> | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Ann Marie Soto    | 0.20         | \$0.00      |
| Ann Marie Soto    | 1.40         | 75.00       |
| Ann Marie Soto    | 18.10        | 135.00      |
| Mary A. Swan      | 5.70         | 90.00       |
| Margaret J. King  | 3.20         | 220.00      |
| Kathy I. Swoyer   | 4.20         | 90.00       |

Expenses

|                                |              |
|--------------------------------|--------------|
| Photocopy charges              | 71.40        |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012 | <u>71.40</u> |

Advances

|                                |               |
|--------------------------------|---------------|
| Courier/Messenger fees         | 231.95        |
| Court Reporter Fees            | 236.00        |
| Total Advances Thru 05/31/2012 | <u>467.95</u> |

Total Current Work 4,682.85

**Balance Due** \$4,682.85

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-10900M  
Statement No: 15994

Recall Petition 4  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |  | Hours |             |
|------------|-----|--|-------|-------------|
| 05/30/2012 | AMS | E-mail from J. Beavers related to new recall petition; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; e-mail to and from A. Block related to same [NO CHARGE]. | 0.80  |             |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered  | 0.80  | <u>0.00</u> |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u> | <u>Hours</u> | <u>Rate</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|
| Ann Marie Soto    | 0.80         | \$0.00      |

Balance Due

\$0.00

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
May 31, 2012  
Account No: 269-20000M  
Statement No: 15995

New Cingular Wireless  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

|            |     |   | Hours |
|------------|-----|---|-------|
| 05/01/2012 | CDB | Telephone call with W. Tanaka to discuss strategy; continue reviewing complaint and researching related issues and defenses.  | 0.04  |
|            | SAL | Conference with C. Bacha regarding case management; review cities' information and prepare table of e-mail contact information in advance of May 8 conference call.   | 0.07  |
| 05/02/2012 | SAL | Review cities' information and prepare table of e-mail contact information in advance of May 8 conference call; e-mail contact information to P. Mason for inclusion in MRSC AT&T Mobility Tax Refund membership list.  | 0.04  |
|            | CDB | Research issues related to defenses to claims and related matters.  | 0.01  |
| 05/03/2012 | SAL | Background research regarding assigned judge M. Spearman; draft notices of appearance; file and serve Black Diamond, Orting, North Bend and Tukwila Notices of Appearance; file maintenance.  | 0.04  |
|            | MRK | Conference with C. Bacha regarding motions practice and discovery issues.   |       |
| 05/07/2012 | SAL | Legal research regarding APR(8)(b); telephone call to C. Bacha regarding same; e-mail to clients regarding NCW's APR(8)(b) motions; finalize Richland and Kennewick notices of appearance; file and serve same; draft notices of appearance on behalf of West Richland and Longview; e-mail exchange with B. Brown and J. McNamara regarding same; receive, review and organize multiple e-mails; file maintenance. | 0.06  |
|            | CDB | Research venue and improper joinder issues; participate in conference call regarding status of the litigation.  | 0.06  |
| 05/08/2012 | SAL | Receive/review multiple e-mails related to case status and direction to enter appearances; draft additional notices of appearance; legal research regarding CR 12(b) motion to dismiss; begin draft of motion to dismiss; file management.  | 0.05  |

New Cingular Wireless  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |     |  | Hours |
|------------|-----|--|-------|
|            | CDB | Discuss strategy and legal issues with colleague; telephone call with M. Scott regarding mediation.  | 0.01  |
| 05/09/2012 | CDB | Telephone call with M. Scott regarding possible mediation; prepare for conference call with working group; prepare and forward e-mail to clients regarding possible motions; prepare and forward e-mail regarding mediation; participate in conference call with working group.    | 0.05  |
|            | SAL | Finalize notices of appearance; draft notices of appearance for DuPont and Covington; telephone call to D. Ridenour, attorney for Yacolt; draft motion to dismiss.   | 0.02  |
| 05/10/2012 | SAL | File and serve notices of appearance of Algona, DuPont, Duvall, Gold Bar, Hunts Point, Lake Forest Park, Roslyn and Sultan; draft, edit and finalize Washougal notice of appearance; file and serve same; receive, review and organize to file multiple e-mails regarding lawsuit. | 0.05  |
|            | CDB | Prepare and forward e-mail for review regarding venue and related issues; discuss related issues with colleague.   | 0.02  |
| 05/11/2012 | CDB | Continue discuss of strategy with colleagues; discuss representation issues with J. Moberg.  | 0.03  |
| 05/14/2012 | SAL | Telephone call from S. Porter, legal assistant to M. Scott, regarding method of service; receive/review and organize multiple e-mails.   | 0.02  |
| 05/15/2012 | CDB | Prepare joint representation memo; forward to S. Loewen to finalize and send.  | 0.01  |
|            | SAL | Receive/review and save electronically to file Withdrawal and Substitution of CIAW counsel for E. Wenatchee; receive/review and save electronically to file order dismissing City of Roy; proof, edit, and finalize status memorandum; e-mail status memo to clients.              | 0.02  |
| 05/16/2012 | SAL | E-mail status memorandum to clients.   | 0.02  |
|            | CDB | Telephone call with colleague to discuss strategy; prepare and forward e-mail to working group regarding same; prepare and forward e-mail to S. Loewen regarding notice to court of complex litigation.  | 0.01  |
| 05/17/2012 | SAL | Finalize status memorandum to clients; e-mail to clients; draft joint defense agreement; prepare service list; file maintenance.   | 0.06  |
| 05/18/2012 | CDB | Review responses to proposal for judgement on pleadings; prepare and forward response regarding same; telephone call with W. Tanaka regarding motion practice; called and left message with M. Scott regarding agreed order.   | 0.01  |

New Cingular Wireless  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |     |   | Hours       |               |
|------------|-----|---|-------------|---------------|
| 05/21/2012 | SAL | Update file.  | 0.01        |               |
| 05/22/2012 | CDB | Telephone call with M. Scott regarding agreed order; prepare and forward e-mail to work group regarding status.                                   | 0.01        |               |
|            | SAL | File maintenance.   | 0.02        |               |
| 05/23/2012 | SAL | Input service information and prepare template declaration of service; organize e-mails to file.  | 0.06        |               |
|            | CDB | Conference call with working group regarding motion practice.   | 0.01        |               |
| 05/29/2012 | SAL | Review and respond to request for electronic copy of declaration of service; update declaration of service; begin draft of stipulation and order. | 0.02        |               |
| 05/30/2012 | SAL | File maintenance.   | 0.01        |               |
| 05/31/2012 | SAL | File management.  | 0.02        |               |
|            | MRK | Draft stipulation and agreed order.   | 0.02        |               |
|            |     | For Current Services Rendered   | <u>0.88</u> | <u>112.90</u> |

Recapitulation

| <u>Timekeeper</u>    | <u>Hours</u> |
|----------------------|--------------|
| Michael R. Kenyon    | 0.02         |
| Christopher D. Bacha | 0.27         |
| Sheryl A. Loewen     | 0.59         |

Expenses

|                                  |             |
|----------------------------------|-------------|
| Photocopy charges                | 0.53        |
| Postage                          | 0.07        |
| Copper Conferencing Svc. 5.9.12  | 1.08        |
| Copper Conferencing Svc. 5.23.12 | <u>0.46</u> |
| Total Expenses Thru 05/31/2012   | <u>2.14</u> |

Advances

|                                |             |
|--------------------------------|-------------|
| Courier/Messenger fees         | <u>0.28</u> |
| Total Advances Thru 05/31/2012 | 0.28        |

Total Current Work 115.32

**Balance Due** \$115.32