



Michael R. Kenyon  
Bruce L. Disend  
Shelley M. Kerslake  
Kari L. Sand  
Chris D. Bacha  
Rachel B. Turpin  
Ann Marie J. Soto  
John P. Long, Jr.  
Danielle M. Evans  
Kim Adams Pratt

February 6, 2014

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 – 5<sup>th</sup> Street  
Gold Bar, WA 98251

Re: January 2014 Billing

General City Attorney Services (269.000)	675.00
Block3 v. Gold Bar (269.110)	<u>84.47</u>

**Current Month's Charges** **\$759.47**

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 January 31, 2014  
 Account No: 269-00000M  
 Statement No: 181454

General City Attorney Services  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

		Hours	
01/02/2014	AMS Review Snohomish County Street ILA; e-mail to L. Loen related to same.	0.60	
01/09/2014	AMS Telephone call to and from D. Beaston related to PRRs and litigation; telephone call from L. Loen related to same.	0.50	
01/16/2014	AMS Meeting with L. Loen related to PRRs and lawsuits.	2.20	
01/22/2014	KIS Review status of litigation matters; update firm chart regarding same.	0.50	
01/23/2014	KIS Compile litigation orders and transcripts for Mayor's review.	0.50	
	AMS Telephone calls to and from L. Loen related to PRRs and litigation; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; discussion with K. Swoyer related to same.	0.40	
01/27/2014	KIS Update files.	0.20	
	AMS E-mail from A. Block related to PRR [NO CHARGE].	0.10	
	For Current Services Rendered	5.00	675.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	0.10	\$0.00
Ann Marie Soto	3.70	150.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	1.20	100.00

Total Current Work	675.00
Previous Balance before Adjustments	\$859.52
01/23/2014 OK TTC	-0.02
<b>Previous Balance</b>	<b>\$859.50</b>

Payments

01/23/2014 Payment	-859.50
--------------------	---------

City of Gold Bar

Page: 2

January 31, 2014

Account No: 269-00000M

Statement No: 181454

General City Attorney Services  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

**Balance Due**

\$675.00

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 January 31, 2014  
 Account No: 269-11000M  
 Statement No: 181457

Block3 v. City of Gold Bar  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

		Hours	
01/09/2014	KIS	Review incoming Notice of Appeal and e-mail same to attorneys; update files [NO CHARGE].	0.10
	AMS	Review Notice of Appeal; e-mails from M. Earl-Hubbard related to same; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same.	0.20
01/13/2014	KIS	Review court docket for proposed new appeal case number; update files.	0.20
		For Current Services Rendered	0.50 <u>50.00</u>

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	0.20	\$150.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	0.10	0.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	0.20	100.00

Expenses

Westlaw Computer Research	<u>34.47</u>
Total Expenses Thru 01/31/2014	34.47
Total Current Work	84.47
<b>Previous Balance</b>	\$1,159.70

Payments

01/23/2014	Payment	-1,159.70
	<b>Balance Due</b>	<u>\$84.47</u>