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City of Gold Bar

Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers
107 - 5 Street

Gold Bar, WA 98251

1657
Re: October 2013 Billing
General City Attorney Services (269.000) 1993.30 5(s 10 !
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Current Month’s Charges $2398.51
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KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
{425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers

Page: 1
October 31, 2013
Account No: 269-00000M

107 = 5th Street
WA 98251

Gold Bar

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

10/01/2013

10/03/2013

10/04/2013

10/10/2013

10/11/2013

10/15/2013

10/18/2013

10/22/2013

10/23/2013

10/24/2013

AMS

AMS

KIs

AMS

AMS

AMS

AMS

AMS

MAS

AMS

Fees

Review resclution related to parking; review
contract with AWC for healthcare benefits; telephone
call to J. Beavers related to same.

Telephone call frem J. Beavers related to meeting.

Update files; respond to A. 30to request regarding
attorney memo.

Meeting with J. Beavers related to various city
matters; telephone call to J. Myers related to same.

Meeting with J. Beavers and D. Beaston related to
various City matters; e-mails from J. Beavers and 2.
Block related to PRRs.

Telephone call from J. Beavers related to variocus
City matters [NO CHARGE].

Review and revise ordinance related to bond
requirements; research statutes and case law related
to same; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same;
review Notice of Claim for US 2 contract; research
statutes and case law related to same; research
codes related to code enfercement; research statutes
related to public hearing requirements; telephone
call to and from J. Beavers related to same; review
resolution related to interfund loan interest rates;
e~mail from J. Beavers related to same.

Telephone call from J. Beavers related to various
city matters.

E-mails from A. Block related to PRRs; e-mail to J.
Beavers related to same; telephone call from J.
Beavers related to same; draft uvtility collection
memo; research statutes related to same.

Review memo for A. Soto regarding utility liens.

Review and revise memo related to utility collecticn
issues; research statutes related to same; meeting

Statement No:

Hours

1.50

1.60

0.10



City of Gold Bar

10/18/2013

Page: 2
October 31, 2013
Account No: 269-00000M

Statement No: 18257
General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
Hours
with J. Beavers related to various city matters. 1.30
10/29/2013 AMS Telephone call from J. Beavers related to various
city matters; review comprehensive plan grant ILA;
review utility research; review Title 2 amendment
research; e-mails to and from J. Beavers and A.
Block related to PRRs. 1.70
10/31/2013 AMS Telephone call from J. Beavers related to PRRs. 0.20
For Current Services Rendered 14.10 1,9%90.00
Recapitulation
Timekeeper Hours Rate
Ann Marie Soto 0.10 $0.0C
Ann Marie Soto 13.20 145.00
Mary A. Swan 0.30 95.00
Kathy I. Swoyer 0.50 95.00
Expenses
FPhotocopy charges 0.30
Facsimile costs 3.00
Total Expenses Thru 10/31/2013 3.30
Total Current Work 1,993.30
Previous Balance 5402.20
Payments
Payment -402.20
Balance Due 51,993.30

_—



City of Gold Bar

Attn:

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SQUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3B20
(425)332-7090

Mayor Joe Beavers Account No:
107 - 5th Street Statement No:
Geld Bar

BlockZ v.
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

10/04/2013

10/10/2013

10/22/2013

10/23/2013

10/28/2013

AMS

AMS

AMS

KIS

KIS

WA 98251

Gold Bar

Fees

Hours
Discussion with J. Beavers related to Motion to
Publish. 0.30

Research court rules related to metions to publish;
discussion with J. Beavers related to same [NO
CHARGE] . 0.10

E-mails from H. McCeonnell related to Block's
response to motion to publish; review response
related to same. 0.40

Review incoming responses to motion to publish;

update files and pleading index; conference with A.

Sote regarding same. ' 0.30
E-mail from A. Block related to Petition for Review

[NO CHARGE]. .10

Review court docket for status; review incoming
petition for review. 0.20

Page: 1

October 31, 2013
269-10300M

18258

For Current Services Rendered 1.40

Recapitulation
Timekeeper Hours Rate
Ann Marie Soto 0.20 50.00
Ann Marie Soto 0.70 145.00
Kathy I. Swoyer 0.50 95.00

Total Current Work

Previous Balance

Balance Due

149.00

149.00

$318.95

$467.95



KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
(425)392-7090

Page: 1
City of Gold Bar October 31, 2013
Attn: Mayecr Joe Beavers Account No: 269-10600M
107 - 5th Street Statement No: 18259
Gold Bar WA 98251
Block v. City of Gold Bar OPMA Vioclation Claim
FOR PROFESSICONAL SERVICES RENDERED
Fees
Hours
10/23/2013 KIS Compile, prepare and organize documents for M.
Kenyon notebooks in preparation for hearing at Court
of Appeals. 1.10
10/25/2013 ALK Background research on OPMA cases [NO CHARGE]. 1.80
For Current Services Rendered 2.90 104.50
Recapitulation
Timekeepar Hours Rate
Alexandra L. Kenyon 1.80 $0.00
Kathy I. Swoyer 1.10 95.00
Total Current Work 104.50
Previous Balance £47.50

Balance Due $152.00

—_—



KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 980627-3820
(425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar
Mayor Joe Beavers

Attn:

107 - 5th Street

Gold Bar

Block3 v.
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

10/01/2013

10/04/2013

10/07/2013

10/10/2013

10/11/2013

10/17/2013

10/22/2013

10/24/2013

AMS

MRK

WA 98251

City of Gold Bar

Fees

Review transcript from court hearing; e-mail from M.
Swan related to same [NO CHARGE].

Craft order with findings; e-mail to M. Kenyon
related to same; review transcript related to same
[NO CHARGE] .

Review transcript of Court's order on summary
judgment motions, revise draft findings and
conclusions [NO CHARGE].

Review findings of fact, conclusions of law and
order for A. Soto; discuss with A. Soto [NO CHARGE].
Draft proposed Order; e-mails from M. Swan and W.
Crittenden related to same; discussion with B.
Sterbank related to same [NO CHARGE].

E-mails from M. Swan and W. Crittenden related to
Order [NO CHARGE].

Discussion with M. Kenyon related to proposed order;
e-mail to and from W. Crittenden related to same [NO
CHARGE] .

E-mail from W. Crittenden related to proposed order
[NO CHARGE].

Draft transmittal letter to Judge Okrent; forward
letter and proposed order to Judge Okrent for entry.
Discussion with M. Kenyon related to Order; review
W. Crittenden edits related to same; review
transmittal letter to court related to same; e-mail
from M. Swan related to same.

For Current Services Rendered

QOctobe

Account No:

Recapitulation
Timekeeper Hours Rate
Michael R. Kenyon 0.60 50.00
Ann Marie Soto 2.10 0.00
bnn Marie Soto 0.30 145.00
Mary A. Swan 0.50 C¢.00

Statement No:

Hours

0.20

3.90

Page: 1

r 31, 2013
269-11000M
18260

81.50



City of Gold Bar

Block3 v. City of Geold Bar
FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES RENDERED

Timekeeper
Mary A. Swan

Expenses

Postage
Parking fees

Tetal Expenses Thru 10/31/2013
Advances

Cocurier/Messenger fees
Court Reporter Fees

Tctal Advances Thru 10/31/2013
Total Current Work

Previous Balance

Balance Due

Hours

0.40

Page: 2

October 31, 2013

Account No: 269-11000M
Statement No: 18260

7.00
57.75

64.75

151.71

$14,427.20

$14,578.91



