

KENYON DISEND, PLLC
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251



Page: 1
March 31, 2011
Account No: 269-00000M
Statement No: 14418

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
03/01/2011	MJK	Phone call with J. Light and Mayor regarding acquisition of utility easement and related construction easement and related; research regarding same.	0.50
03/03/2011	KIS	Perform general filing of miscellaneous city matters.	0.40
03/04/2011	KIS	E-mail and telephone call from J. Beavers regarding easement; e-mail to M. King regarding same.	0.20
	MJK	Review and update files for current matters; conference with K. Swoyer regarding same.	0.20
	KIS	E-mail and telephone call from J. Beavers regarding easement; e-mail to M. King regarding same.	0.20
03/07/2011	MJK	Review and draft easement for water line and construction for water tank; edits to same; e-mail to J. Beavers regarding same.	0.70
	KIS	Review, prepare and organize documents for general city files.	0.30
03/08/2011	MJK	Review e-mails from J. Light; review documents and and sign opinion of counsel for water tank project; e-mail same to J. Light.	0.40
03/09/2011	KIS	Review e-mails regarding signed opinion letter; meet with M. King regarding same; prepare letter enclosing signed opinion letter to J. Light.	0.70
03/11/2011	MJK	Phone call with J. Beavers; phone calls with J. Light regarding CUP for church and SEPA requirements; research regarding same; follow up phone call with J. Light.	1.60
03/14/2011	KIS	Review incoming e-mails regarding PRA requests; prepare documents for file.	0.30
03/23/2011	MJK	Review and respond to e-mails from J. Beaver regarding plat questions and storm water.	0.40

General City Attorney Services
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		Hours	
03/30/2011	MJK Phone call with Mayor regarding PRR requests.	0.30	
	For Current Services Rendered	<u>6.20</u>	<u>1,091.00</u>

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Margaret J. King	4.10	\$220.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	2.10	90.00

Expenses

Westlaw Computer Research	1.26
Total Expenses Thru 03/31/2011	<u>1.26</u>
Total Current Work	1,092.26
Previous Balance	\$4,541.27

Payments

03/16/2011	Payment	-3,176.23
04/07/2011	Payment	<u>-1,365.04</u>
	Total Payments	-4,541.27
	Balance Due	<u><u>\$1,092.26</u></u>

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1
March 31, 2011
Account No: 269-10000M
Statement No: 14419

Forbes vs. Gold Bar
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
03/02/2011	KIS	Meet with M. King regarding notice of unavailability; begin to prepare same for M. King signature; retrieve case events from court of appeals and prepare same for M. King review; review notice of court's receipt of Petitioner's second attempt to file motion but her failure to serve same; review letter from Court of Appeals noting deadline for Petitioner to serve motion.	1.30
03/03/2011	KIS	Finalize Notice of Unavailability for filing and service; update pleadings index and file; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding deadlines; e-mail Notice of Unavailability and Court of Appeals' letters to J. Beavers; meet with M. King; update calendar deadlines.	1.50
	MJK	Review and sign Notice of Unavailability; review e-mails from K. Swoyer regarding same.	0.10
03/11/2011	MJK	Respond to Forbes request for discretionary review.	0.90
	KIS	Telephone call from J. Beavers regarding receipt of petitioner's motion for discretionary review; telephone call to M. King regarding same; analyze motion for compliance with court rules and prepare attorney calendar regarding filing of responsive pleadings; consult appellate rules to confirm procedures; organize and update pleadings and index.	2.00
03/14/2011	MJK	Reserach and draft Answer to Forbes Motion.	2.60
	KIS	Begin draft of answer to Motion for Discretionary Review; meet with M. King regarding same.	1.10
03/15/2011	MJK	Draft response; conference with M. Kenyon regarding same.	1.80
03/17/2011	MRK	Review/revise City's response to motion for discretionary review, review Forbes' motion.	0.50
	KIS	Review Answer and begin preparation of Appendix to Answer to Motion for Discretionary Review.	0.30
	.		

Forbes vs. Gold Bar
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

			Hours		
03/18/2011	MRK	Telephone conference with M. King regarding Forbes public records issues.	0.20		
	MCS	Proof and edit Answer to Motion for Discretionary Review.	1.00		
	KIS	Review and finalize Answer to Petition for Review; compile and prepare exhibits for Appendix for same; consult court website and note oral argument for Petition for Review; notify attorney and make preparations to comply with deadlines; prepare table of contents, authorities and appendix for Answer; meet with M. King regarding same.	4.40		
03/21/2011	MJK	Finalize Answer to Petition for Discretionary Review.	1.30		
	KIS	Update appendix to answer to Motion for Discretionary Review; finalize answer and appendix for filing and service; e-mail answer to client and S. Forbes; update pleadings file and index.	2.20		
	MCS	Proof and edit final version of Answer to Motion for Discretionary Review.	0.50		
For Current Services Rendered			21.70	2,962.00	

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Michael R. Kenyon	0.70	\$255.00
Margaret C. Starkey	1.50	105.00
Margaret J. King	6.70	220.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	12.80	90.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	41.70
Postage	0.88
Total Expenses Thru 03/31/2011	42.58

Advances

Courier/Messenger fees	174.50
Total Advances Thru 03/31/2011	174.50

Total Current Work 3,179.08

Previous Balance \$5,220.58

Payments

03/16/2011	Payment	-4,400.75
04/07/2011	Payment	-819.83
Total Payments		-5,220.58

Balance Due \$3,179.08