

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 December 31, 2011  
 Account No: 269-00000M  
 Statement No: 15416

General City Attorney Services  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours	
12/16/2011	AMS	E-mail to and from L. Kelly related to ordinance and resolution for review; research statutes related to same; telephone call from L. Kelly related to same.	0.80	
12/21/2011	AMS	E-mail from L. Kelly related to budget ordinance; review ordinance related to same.	0.40	
12/22/2011	KIS	Proof and format ordinance regarding expenditures.	0.40	
	AMS	Edit budget ordinance; multiple discussions with K. Swoyer related to same; e-mail to and from K. Swoyer related to same; e-mail to L. Kelly related to same.	0.70	
12/23/2011	KIS	Review, prepare and organize general City documents for files.	0.20	
12/28/2011	MJK	Review e-mails from A. Block regarding various PRRs; communicate with Mayor regarding same.	0.30	
		For Current Services Rendered	2.80	376.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	1.90	\$135.00
Margaret J. King	0.30	220.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	0.60	90.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	13.95
Postage	0.44
Westlaw Computer Research	352.57
Total Expenses Thru 12/31/2011	366.96
Total Current Work	743.46
<b>Previous Balance</b>	<b>\$4,452.20</b>

City of Gold Bar

Page: 2  
December 31, 2011  
Account No: 269-00000M  
Statement No: 15416

General City Attorney Services  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

**Balance Due**

\$5,195.66

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
(425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
December 31, 2011  
Account No: 269-10000M  
Statement No: 15417

Forbes vs. Gold Bar  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

	<b>Previous Balance</b>		\$10,169.45
		<u>Payments</u>	
12/14/2011	Payment		-9,821.54
	<b>Balance Due</b>		<u>\$347.91</u>

KENYON DISEND, PLLC  
 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH  
 ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820  
 (425) 392-7090

City of Gold Bar  
 Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
 107 - 5th Street  
 Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
 December 31, 2011  
 Account No: 269-10200M  
 Statement No: 15418

Block v. City of Gold Bar  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED

Fees

			Hours	
12/01/2011	MAE	Update pleadings file; calendar deadlines.	0.30	
12/02/2011	MAE	Discuss case with M. King and A. Soto; review court website; prepare notice of hearing for City's motion for order of dismissal; review information in preparation of interrogatories.	0.50	
12/06/2011	MAE	Review court rules; draft notice of hearing for motion for default before the court commissioner; discuss with M. King.	0.50	
12/08/2011	KIS	Prepare exhibits to declaration; meet with A. Soto regarding briefing status.	1.20	
		For Current Services Rendered	2.50	225.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Mary A. Eichelberger	1.30	\$90.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	1.20	90.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	2.40
Total Expenses Thru 12/31/2011	2.40
Total Current Work	227.40
<b>Previous Balance</b>	<b>\$42.99</b>

Payments

12/14/2011	Payment	-42.99
	<b>Balance Due</b>	<b>\$227.40</b>

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
December 31, 2011  
Account No: 269-10300M  
Statement No: 15419

Block2 v. Gold Bar  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
12/01/2011	MJK	Attend Deposition of Anne Block (1.9); review e-mail from A. Block regarding her deposition; research regarding Rule 37 sanctions for failure to appear to party deposition; conference with M. Kenyon regarding same.	2.80
	AMS	At City Hall for deposition of A. Block; discussion with M. King and J. Beavers related to same [NO CHARGE].	0.90
	MJK	Travel to and from Deposition of Anne Block.	0.60
12/02/2011	MJK	Meet with A. Soto and M. Eichelberger regarding drafting Motion to Dismiss and for attorney fees; research dismissal for failure of A. Block to appear at her deposition.	1.10
	AMS	Multiple discussions with M. King and M. Eichelberger related to motion to dismiss; research civil rules related to same; draft motion and declarations related to same.	0.50
12/05/2011	AMS	Multiple discussions with M. King related to motion to dismiss; draft declarations related to same; telephone call to C. Wright related to same; multiple e-mails to M. King related to same.	4.10
	KIS	Compile documents for A. Soto review.	0.60
12/06/2011	AMS	Multiple discussions with M. King related to motion for sanctions; research court rules and case law related to same; revise motion related to same; discussion with M. Eichelberger related to same; revise C. Wright declaration related to same; telephone call from C. Wright related to same; e-mail to and from L. Kelly related to same.	5.00
	MJK	Conference with A. Soto regarding Block litigation; edits to motion for sanctions and declaration; review e-mails; e-mail to Mayor regarding status of litigation.	2.10
12/07/2011	AMS	Multiple discussions with M. King related to motion for sanctions; revise declaration related	

Block2 v. Gold Bar

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

			Hours
		to same; revise motion related to same.	3.40
	MAE	Review order.	0.30
	MJK	Draft and revise Declaration and Motion and Order requesting attorney fees and sanctions for failure of A. Block to appear for deposition.	4.80
12/08/2011	AMS	Review and edit motion for sanctions and declarations; multiple discussions with M. King related to same; multiple discussions with K. Swoyer related to same.	3.90
12/09/2011	KIS	Review, proof and format motion and verify citations therein.	2.80
12/12/2011	KIS	Telephone call to court regarding docket notice; prepare notice for hearing; prepare exhibits to M. King declaration; finalize motion, declarations and proposed order for filing and service.	4.40
12/14/2011	MJK	Draft responses to Discovery Requests and Requests for Admissions; conference with K. Swoyer and M. Eichelberger regarding notice of deposition.	2.70
	KIS	Calendar upcoming deadlines; prepare briefing and prepare letter to opposing party enclosing same.	1.30
	AMS	Multiple discussions with M. King related to discovery requests and RFAs; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same; draft RFAs related to same; multiple e-mails from M. King related to same; edit interrogatories related to same.	1.10
12/15/2011	MAE	Prepare subpoena for deposition and notice of deposition; serve on plaintiff via regular mail and e-mail; telephone call to court reporter.	1.00
	AMS	Telephone call to C. Wright related to interrogatories; discussion with M. King related to same; e-mail to J. Beavers related to same; telephone call to J. Beavers related to same.	0.30
12/16/2011	AMS	Multiple telephone calls from J. Beavers related to discovery requests; multiple e-mails from J. Beavers related to same; multiple discussions with K. Swoyer related to same; revise interrogatories related to same; multiple e-mails to and from K. Swoyer and M. King related to same.	0.90
	KIS	Review, format and finalize responses to Admissions and e-mail same to J. Beavers for review and signature on same; prepare notice confirming hearing and e-mail same to Snohomish Co. Superior Court; telephone call from court changing hearing location; e-mail to parties regarding same; update calendar regarding same; calculate discovery deadlines and notify attorneys regarding same.	2.20

Block2 v. Gold Bar  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		Hours
	MJK Review and respond to e-mails from K. Swoyer regarding discovery.	0.20
12/19/2011	MAE Finish preparing working copy binder for tomorrow's hearing.	0.20
	MJK Review e-mail from A. Block; prepare for hearing.	0.60
	KIS Finalize discovery response and documents for same for service to plaintiff; e-mail copies to parties; e-mail to client regarding hearing.	1.40
12/20/2011	SAL Review files and respond to request from M. King regarding attorneys fees declaration.	0.40
	MAE Review order; prepare declaration of service; forward to A. Block via e-mail and regular mail; discuss with M. King; begin calculating costs for upcoming motion for costs pursuant to court's ruling.	0.80
	AMS In court for hearing on motion for sanctions and to compel; meeting with J. Beavers and M. King related to same [NO CHARGE].	1.00
	MJK Argue Motion for Sanctions (.6); meet with Mayor and A. Soto regarding discovery.	1.30
	MJK Roundtrip travel to argue Motion for Sanctions.	1.10
12/21/2011	MAE Update file; open new pleadings file.	0.40
	KIS Review Order on City's Motion for Costs; begin to review and proof M. Declaration; calendar deadlines.	0.80
	MJK Draft fee affidavit.	0.70
12/22/2011	KIS Notify attorney regarding upcoming deadline for discovery responses from plaintiff.	0.20
12/23/2011	AMS Multiple e-mails from A. Block and M. King related to lawsuit.	0.30
	KIS Review, prepare and organize e-mails for files.	0.40
12/27/2011	AMS Revise declaration in support of award of fees; e-mail to M. King related to same; e-mail to J. Beavers related to Subpoena Duces Tecum; telephone call from J. Beavers related to same; discussion with M. Kenyon related to same.	0.50
12/28/2011	MJK Finalize motion for costs and fees (.8); review e-mails from A. Block regarding discovery; review rules and draft e-mail to A. Block regarding same.	2.00
	KIS Review, prepare and organize e-mails for case file; prepare calendar regarding J. Beavers' deposition.	1.30
12/29/2011	MJK Respond to e-mails from A. Block; finalize declaration for sanctions; conference with K. Swoyer regarding Discovery service dates; draft e-mail to A. Block regarding same.	1.80
	KIS Review, compile and organize e-mails regarding	

Block2 v. Gold Bar  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		Hours
	conflicts in plaintiff's assertions; retrieve and compile documents confirming discovery service; compile documents for M. King review for her declaration; proof and format M. King declaration regarding fees; telephone call to court to confirm procedures for ex parte; organize pleadings for M. King in preparation for 12/30/11 ex-parte hearing; e-mail declaration and proposed orders to plaintiff.	4.20
AMS	Multiple e-mails from M. King and A. Block related to lawsuit; multiple discussions with M. King related to same; discussion with M. King related to sanctions.	1.20
12/30/2011 MJK	Present Declaration of Attorney Fees, Costs and a proposed order in Superior Court; hearing before court; conference with K. Swoyer regarding service of order; phone call with J. Beavers regarding Order Granting Fees and Costs; review and respond to numerous e-mails from A. Block (.7).	2.40
KIS	E-mail from M. King regarding revised orders; scan the same and e-mail to A. Block; review incoming e-mails; prepare executed order to interested parties; meet with M. King regarding case plan.	0.90
MJK	Travel to and from Superior Court.	1.10
	For Current Services Rendered	72.00
		10,235.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	1.90	\$0.00
Ann Marie Soto	21.20	135.00
Mary A. Eichelberger	2.70	90.00
Sheryl A. Loewen	0.40	95.00
Margaret J. King	2.20	75.00
Margaret J. King	23.10	220.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	20.50	90.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	49.35
Postage	26.64
Total Expenses Thru 12/31/2011	75.99
Total Current Work	10,310.99
Previous Balance	\$7,392.15
Balance Due	\$17,703.14

City of Gold Bar  
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers  
107 - 5th Street  
Gold Bar WA 98251

Page: 1  
December 31, 2011  
Account No: 269-10400M  
Statement No: 15420

Recall Petition  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
12/01/2011	AMS	In court for recall hearing [NO CHARGE FOR TRAVEL TIME]; discussion with M. King related to same; telephone call from M. King related to same; research statutes related to same.	2.10
	KIS	Prepare pleadings for file; prepare case information form; review order dismissing petition.	2.40
	MJK	Prepare for Recall Petition Hearing (hours carried over from night before on prep); attend Recall Petition Hearing in Superior Court (2.2).	7.40
	MJK	Travel to and from Petition Hearing in Superior Court.	1.70
12/06/2011	SAL	E-mail exchange with G. Sivley, Asst. Snohomish County Prosecutor, regarding order on recall charges; file and serve order on recall charges; update file information related to A. Block service addresses.	1.70
	MJK	Review e-mails from A. Block; conference with A. Soto and M. Eichelberger regarding same; e-mail to J. Beaver regarding status of same.	0.80
12/07/2011	MAE	Telephone call to the court reporter; order copy of transcript from the hearing; send payment.	0.30
12/08/2011	MAE	Prepare cover letter to court reporter regarding payment for transcript.	0.30
12/14/2011	MJK		0.40
12/15/2011	MAE	Review court records for potential appeal filing.	0.20
	MJK	E-mail to Mayor regarding failure to file timely appeal on recall matter; research regarding same.	0.50
12/27/2011	AMS	Research case law related to sanctions; e-mail to M. King related to same; draft declaration in support of motion for sanctions.	3.00
12/28/2011	MJK	Review e-mails from A. Block regarding recall	

Recall Petition  
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		Hours	
	petition; research regarding appeal deadline; e-mail to A. Block regarding appeal deadline.	0.70	
12/29/2011	MAE Review notice of appeal; scan to client file; update pleading file.	0.30	
	KIS Notify attorney regarding upcoming deadlines and make preparations to comply with same.	0.70	
	AMS Multiple e-mails from M. King and A. Block related to recall appeal; discussion with M. King related to same.	0.40	
12/30/2011	AMS Telephone call to and from J. Beavers related to motion for sanctions; e-mail from J. Beavers related to same.	0.20	
	For Current Services Rendered	23.10	3,592.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Ann Marie Soto	5.70	\$135.00
Mary A. Eichelberger	1.10	90.00
Sheryl A. Loewen	1.70	95.00
Margaret J. King	1.70	75.00
Margaret J. King	9.80	220.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	3.10	90.00

Expenses

Postage	0.88
Westlaw Computer Research	11.84
Total Expenses Thru 12/31/2011	12.72

Advances

Court Reporter Fees	72.00
Total Advances Thru 12/31/2011	72.00

Total Current Work 3,677.22

Previous Balance \$2,941.50

Balance Due \$6,618.72