### KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1 September 30, 2010 Account No: 269-00000M Statement No: 13648

Hours

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

#### Fees

09/01/2010 MJK		Review e-mails; conference with K. Swoyer regarding PRR requests.	Hours
		regarding rkk requests.	0.50
09/02/2010	KIS	Telephone call from P. Brenton regarding records; meet with M. King regarding same.	0.20
09/03/2010	MAE KIS MJK	Review state website regarding rental housing and business licensing. Review incoming e-mails and prepare same for files. Phone call with L. Kelley regarding comprehensive plan resolution and review of 2005 comprehensive plan and 2009 updates; conference with M. Eichelberger regarding rental housing business licenses; memorandum to P. Brenton regarding PRA question.	0.50
09/07/2010	BCS MJK	Review draft ordinance and City's parks chapter and appendix to comprehensive plan; telephone conference with Mayor Beavers regarding same; revise draft resolution amending comprehensive plan 20-year CIP; draft and revise e-mail to Mayor Beavers regarding same.  Review and draft and edit Findings for Council.	2.00
09/08/2010	KIS	Regarding sign code, telephone call from J. Beavers regarding article; prepare and e-mail same to M. King.	0.40
.09/13/2010	KIS	Regarding sign code, review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for file; review statutes regarding LUPA appeal and prepare calendar regarding petitioner's duty regarding same.	0.50
09/21/2010	AMS	E-mail from M. King related to sign code; research ordinances and statutory law related to same.	0.80
09/22/2010	AMS	Discussion with M. King related to sign code amendments; review Parker Outdoor file related	

Page: 2
September 30, 2010
Account No: 269-0000M
Statement No: 13648

# General City Attorney Services FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

	MJK	to same; research statutes and ordinances related to same. Review and edits to draft sign code; conference with A. Soto regarding sign ordinance; phone		Но	urs	
				2	.80	
		call with Mayor regarding agenda ited draft resolution regarding impact fe		1	.40	
09/23/2010	AMS	Discussion with M. King related to sordinance; draft ordinance related to research case law and statutes related political signs; e-mail to M. King resame.	o same; ed to	2	.60	
09/27/2010	MJK	Review and revise A. Soto edits to s	ign code.	1	.00	
09/28/2010	MJK	Phone call with Mayor regarding plant conference with A. Soto regarding fit draft sign ordinance; finalize edits	nal edits to			
	AMS	same. Review and edit sign code ordinance;			.50	
		with M. King related to same; e-mail related to same.		g	.40	
		For Current Services Rendered		18	.70	3,003.00
		Recapitulation				
		imekeeper	Hours	Rate		
		nn Marie Soto ary A. Eichelberger	7.60 0.50	\$120.00 85.00		
		argaret J. King	7.10	210.00		
	Kathy I. Swoyer 1.50			85.00 215.00		
	Bob C. Sterbank 2.00					
		Expenses				
	Westlaw Computer Research					484.20
	Total Expenses Thru 09/30/2010					484.20
		Total Current Work				3,487.20
		Previous Balance				\$7,689.77
<u>Payments</u>						
09/10/2010		Payment				-4,589.35
09/10/2010		Payment				-3.00
09/27/2010		Payment				-3,100.42
		Total Payments				-7,692.77
		Balance Due				\$3,484.20

### KENYON DISEND, PLLC 11 FRONT STREET SOUTH ISSAQUAH, WA 98027-3820 (425)392-7090

City of Gold Bar Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers 107 - 5th Street Gold Bar WA 98251 Page: 1 September 30, 2010 Account No: 269-10000M Statement No: 13649

Hours

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

## Fees

09/01/2010	KIS	Telephone call from P. Brenton; meet with M. King regarding same.	0.20
09/03/2010	KIS	Telephone calls to and from J. Beavers regarding S. Forbes request; telephone call to P. Brenton regarding documents; e-mail to S. Forbes regarding continuance.	0.70
09/06/2010	MJK	Review documents; draft response to interrogatories.	1.90
09/07/2010	MRK MAE	Conference with M. King regarding discovery issues and litigation strategy. Review responses to plaintiff's interrogatories and requests for production of documents; discuss with M. King; revise interrogatory answers and finalize; scan and forward to	0.40
	MJK	plaintiff. Review documents and draft response to interrogatories; phone call with P. Brenton and L. Kelley.	<ul><li>2.50</li><li>4.30</li></ul>
09/08/2010	KIS	Begin to review incoming e-mails and prepare same for file; revise interrogatory responses per M. King advisement; prepare signature page to responses and e-mail same to J. Beavers; e-mail and mail revised responses to S. Forbes.	2.00
09/10/2010	KIS	Review, prepare and organize e-mails and attachments for file.	0.50
09/13/2010	KIS	E-mail to S. Forbes requesting Word version of second discovery requests.	0.20
09/15/2010	MJK KIS	Respond to discovery request; conference with P. Brenton regarding documents; conference with K. Swoyer regarding same; review of logs and information from Mayor.  E-mail from S. Forbes enclosing Word version of discovery; e-mail from S. Forbes regarding pre-assignment; meet with M. King regarding	1.50

Page: 2 September 30, 2010 Account No: 269-10000M

Statement No: 13649

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		same.	Hours 0.30
09/16/2010	MJK KIS	Phone calls with P. Brenton; conference with K. Swoyer; review and edit response.  Continue to work on discovery responses; meet with M. King regarding same; telephone conference with P. Brenton regarding same; e-mail to J. Beavers attaching signature page; finalize discovery responses and e-mail same to S. Forbes; e-mail from S. Forbes regarding format; re-format Appendix and e-mail to S. Forbes; review, prepare and organize e-mails and attachments for file.	3.80
09/17/2010	KIS	E-mail complaint to P. Brenton; review incoming e-mails; prepare letter to S. Forbes enclosing signature page and hard copy of interrogatory responses and Appendix A of same.	1.00
09/20/2010	MJK	Phone call with Mayor regarding discovery; conference with K. Swoyer regarding same.	0.30
09/23/2010	KIS MJK	Retrieve Alliance case for S. Forbes letter regarding depositions; begin to format letter for M. King review. Review documents from Mayor; e-mail regarding same; conference with K. Swoyer and P. Brenton regarding same; draft letter to S. Forbes regarding discovery; phone call with J. Myers, outside counsel.	0.50
09/24/2010	MJK	Draft and revise letter to S. Forbes regarding depositions; telephone conference with Mayor.	1.30
09/27/2010	KIS MJK	Review incoming letter from S. Forbes; review, format and finalize M. King letter to S. Forbes; e-mail copies of correspondence to client; telephone calls to and from P. Brenton regarding e-mails; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding e-mails; begin preparation of supplemental responses.  Draft response letter to S. Forbes regarding discovery issues; review and draft litigation documents.	3.10
09/28/2010	MJK	Review supplemental discovery responses; conference with J. Beavers and K. Swoyer regarding same; review and draft litigation documents; phone call with P. Brenton.	3.30 4.40
09/29/2010	KIS	Review, prepare and organize e-mails and attachments for files; telephone call from P. Brenton regarding depositions; e-mail to M. King regarding discovery; continue to work on supplemental discovery responses; e-mail same to J. Beavers and M. King.	2.50

Page: 3 September 30, 2010

Account No: 269-10000M

Statement No: 13649

Forbes vs. Gold Bar FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

09/30/2010	KIS	Finalize City's supplemental responses to first discovery requests; e-mail and mail same to S. Forbes; e-mails from P. Brenton regarding			Hours		
	Declaration; e-mail from and to J. Beavers regarding discovery; prepare e-mails for files.  For Current Services Rendered					$\frac{1.40}{40.80}$	6,344.50
		Re	capitulation				
	М. Ма Ма	imekeeper Ichael R. Kenyon ary A. Eichelberger argaret J. King athy I. Swoyer		0.40 2.50 22.50 15.40	Rate \$245.00 85.00 210.00 85.00		
Expenses							
		Photocopy charges Postage Westlaw Computer Resea Total Expenses Thru 09					34.80 9.60 146.03 190.43
	Total Current Work						6,534.93
Previous Balance							\$4,425.73
Payments							
09/10/2010 09/27/2010		Payment Payment Total Payments					$\begin{array}{r} -194.64 \\ -4,231.09 \\ \hline -4,425.73 \end{array}$
		Balance Due					\$6,534.93