

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
08/02/2010	SMK	Review e-mail from M. King regarding administrative appeal; review planning commission minutes; draft e-mail to M. King regarding options for appeal processing.	0.40
08/05/2010	MJK	Office hours.	1.20
08/06/2010	KIS	Review multiple e-mails for multiple matters forwarded by M. King; prepare, print out, and organize same for files.	0.80
08/09/2010	KIS	Regarding Parker sign application, review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for files.	0.50
08/11/2010	KIS	Regarding sign code, review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for file.	0.30
08/12/2010	MJK	Research regarding jurisdiction for sign appeal.	0.50
08/13/2010	MJK	Review and edit business license ordinance; phone call with Mayor; phone calls with L. Kelly.	1.10
08/16/2010	MJK	Draft appeal procedures for sign appeal.	1.70
08/17/2010	MJK	Phone call and e-mail to B. Dorsey, attorney for Parker Outdoor Inc.; phone call with staff regarding office hours; prepare for and attend City Council meeting and Executive Session.	4.20
08/18/2010	MJK	Review e-mail from B. Dorsey; phone call with Mayor.	0.30
	KIS	Regarding sign code, review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for file.	0.30
08/19/2010	KIS	Regarding Parker Outdoor, prepare case information form; review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for files.	0.50
08/20/2010	KIS	Review and organize general city e-mails for	

General City Attorney Services
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

		Hours	
	files.	0.30	
08/23/2010	MJK Phone call with outside council and RMSCA; review documents and e-mails.	1.70	
08/24/2010	MJK Review and edit of draft privilege log; phone call with Mayor and review draft ILA.	0.70	
08/27/2010	KIS Review and organize e-mails for files.	0.30	
	MJK Review and revise draft resolution; review and respond to e-mails from B. Dorsey regarding sign permit.	0.70	
08/30/2010	MJK Review of tort claim; forward same to J. Howard; phone call with Mayor.	0.50	
	KIS Review and organize incoming e-mails for file; review amended tort claim and incoming denial letters from J. Howard.	0.30	
	For Current Services Rendered	16.30	3,012.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Shelley M. Kerslake	0.40	\$215.00
Margaret J. King	12.60	210.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	3.30	85.00

Expenses

Facsimile costs	0.30
Westlaw Computer Research	87.62
Total Expenses Thru 08/31/2010	87.92
 Total Current Work	 3,100.42
 Previous Balance	 \$6,620.34

Payments

08/02/2010	Payment	-2,030.99
	 Balance Due	 <u>\$7,689.77</u>

August 31, 2010

Account No: 269-10000M

Statement No: 13550

City of Gold Bar
Attn: Mayor Joe Beavers
107 - 5th Street
Gold Bar WA 98251

Forbes vs. Gold Bar
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Fees

			Hours
08/03/2010	MRK	Conference with M. King regarding litigation strategy.	0.20
	MJK	Research case law.	1.70
08/04/2010	KIS	Review, prepare and organize incoming e-mails for file; draft motion and research statutes regarding same.	2.90
	MJK	Draft motion for Susan Forbes case.	0.90
08/05/2010	KIS	Continue drafting motion; summarize facts of claim; insert table identifying City's multiple responses to record requests.	3.90
08/09/2010	KIS	Review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for file; notify attorney and make preparations to comply with discovery deadlines.	0.80
08/11/2010	MJK	Review and edit draft pleading and motions	0.90
	KIS	Prepare letter regarding discovery conference for M. King review; review, prepare and organize e-mails and documents for files.	1.70
08/12/2010	MJK	Draft motions	1.80
08/16/2010	KIS	Evaluate J. Beavers summaries of PRR activity; draft declaration in support of motion for M. King review; begin to compile exhibits regarding same; e-mail declaration to M. King; calendar discovery conference and notify attorney regarding same; update and organize e-mails for files.	3.50
08/17/2010	MJK	Prepare for conference call regarding discovery; phone call with Susan Forbes regarding discovery objections to 1st Set of Interrogatories; prepare for and attend office hours, City Council meeting and Executive Session.	3.30
08/18/2010	KIS	Review e-mails and documents for files; calendar deadlines for second discovery requests; work on file; e-mail to City regarding withdrawn claims.	1.80

Forbes vs. Gold Bar
 FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

			Hours	
	MJK	Phone call with Mayor.	0.20	
08/20/2010	KIS	Work on file and motions; review and organize e-mails for files.	1.00	
08/26/2010	KIS	Review incoming e-mail from J. Beavers regarding PRR response and meet with M. King regarding same.	0.30	
	MJK	Phone call with Mayor; review of draft log; draft motion.	1.80	
08/27/2010	KIS	E-mail to J. Beavers regarding discovery; telephone call from J. Beavers regarding same; e-mail to and from J. Howard; prepare and organize e-mails for file.	1.20	
	MJK	Review privileged documents and logs; draft motion; phone call with Mayor; e-mail to outside counsel.	1.00	
08/30/2010	MJK	Conference with K. Swoyer regarding discovery; phone call with Mayor.	0.60	
	KIS	Review and prepare e-mails for file; telephone call from P. Brenton regarding documents.	0.40	
08/31/2010	MJK	Review draft responses to discovery; e-mail to K. Swoyer regarding same.	0.60	
		For Current Services Rendered	30.50	4,224.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Michael R. Kenyon	0.20	\$245.00
Margaret J. King	12.80	210.00
Kathy I. Swoyer	17.50	85.00

Expenses

Photocopy charges	6.15
Postage	0.44
Total Expenses Thru 08/31/2010	<u>6.59</u>

Total Current Work 4,231.09

Previous Balance \$3,281.62

Payments

08/02/2010 Payment -3,086.98

Balance Due \$4,425.73